















































Description

Position

Milestone

WIP_Date

Hours

II[)\A/_]JI

Value

Narration

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Assets

24/05/2022

0.80

$524.00

reviewed correspondence relating to costs assessments regarding claim against Hall
Chadwick/reviewed resnonse to same/provide instructions to our solicitors

BR

Clark Jarrold

Partner

Assets

27/04/2022

0.40

$260.00

Consider and then discuss query from David Whyte with Craig re use of hindsight in
assessina impairment of loans etc

BR

Charles Haines

Director

Assets

4/11/2021

0.20

$108.00

Review solicitors email, meet staff regarding preparation of investor list by court
mandated due date

BR

Charles Haines

Director

Assets

5/09/2022

0.10

$55.50

Ph call appointee regarding update in preparation for meeting

BR

Charles Haines

Director

Assets

8/02/2023

0.10

$55.50

Update regarding COI approval of settlement offer and judicial advice status, planning for
finalisation

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Assets

20/09/2021

0.40

$136.00

Download the meeting minutes in the last 12 months for Equititrust Limited to provide to
David for review in relation to the liquidators claim against the fund for remuneration and

avnancec

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Assets

27/09/2021

0.40

$136.00

Prepare email to our solicitors to draft an affidavit for responses to the notice to
members.

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Assets

22/11/2021

1.20

$408.00

Locate and review information regarding management fees, interest distributions and
assets of the Fund for FY2010 and FY2011 to provide to our solicitors for the points of

claim reaardina the liauidators claim for remineration and exynensesg

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Assets

23/11/2021

0.70

$238.00

Locate and review information regarding management fees, interest distributions and
assets of the Fund for FY2010 and FY2011 to provide to our solicitors for the points of

claim raaardina thae linuidatare claim far remiinaratinn and avnancac

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Assets

23/11/2021

$510.00

Locate and review information regarding management fees, interest distributions and
assets of the Fund for FY2010 and FY2011 to provide to our solicitors for the points of

claim reaardina the liauidators claim for remuneration and exynensesg

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Assets

24/11/2021

0.80

$272.00

Locate and review information regarding management fees, interest distributions and
assets of the Fund for FY2010 and FY2011 to provide to our solicitors for the points of

claim raaardina thae linuidatare claim far remiinaratinn and avnancac

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Assets

25/11/2021

0.30

$102.00

Locate and review information regarding management fees, interest distributions and
assets of the Fund for FY2010 and FY2011 to provide to our solicitors for the points of

claim reaardina the liauidators claim for remineration and exynensesg

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Assets

25/11/2021

1.20

$408.00

Locate and review information regarding management fees, interest distributions and
assets of the Fund for FY2010 and FY2011 to provide to our solicitors for the points of

claim raaardina thae linuidatare claim far remiinaratinn and avnancac

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Assets

25/11/2021

0.90

$306.00

Locate and review information regarding management fees, interest distributions and
assets of the Fund for FY2010 and FY2011 to provide to our solicitors for the points of

claim reaardina the liauidatore claim for remuneration and exynensesg

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Assets

25/11/2021

$170.00

Locate and review information regarding management fees, interest distributions and
assets of the Fund for FY2010 and FY2011 to provide to our solicitors for the points of

claim raaardina thae linuidatare claim far remiinaratinn and avnancac

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Assets

25/11/2021

$204.00

Locate and review information regarding management fees, interest distributions and
assets of the Fund for FY2010 and FY2011 to provide to our solicitors for the points of

claim reaardina the liauidatore claim for remuneration and exynensesg

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Assets

3/12/2021

$170.00

Locate the EPF constitution to provide to our solicitors for the liquidators claim for
remuneration and exnenses

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Assets

7/11/2022

$390.00

Locate and review documents relating to an assigned loan in order to provide support for
removal of a PPSR reaistration

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Assets

7/11/2022

$429.00

Locate and review documents relating to an assigned loan in order to provide support for
removal of a PPSR reaistration

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Assets

8/11/2022

0.70

$273.00

Locate and review documents relating to an assigned loan in order to provide support for
removal of a PPSR reaistration

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Assets

14/11/2022

0.80

$312.00

Review email from the liquidators regarding PPSR registrations over creditors. Locate and

review documentation to determine the status of the loans and whether the PPSR
ranictratinn can ha remaved Advice David findinac

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Assets

16/11/2022

0.40

$156.00

Review email from the liquidators regarding PPSR registrations over creditors. Locate and
review documentation to determine the status of the loans and whether the PPSR
reaictration can he removed Advice David findinac
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BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Assets 16/11/2022 1.10 $429.00|Review email from the liquidators regarding PPSR registrations over creditors. Locate and
review documentation to determine the status of the loans and whether the PPSR
ranictratinn can ha remaved Advice David findinac

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Assets 16/11/2022 1.40 $546.00[Review email from the liquidators regarding PPSR registrations over creditors. Locate and
review documentation to determine the status of the loans and whether the PPSR
reaictration can he removed Advice David findinac

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Assets 3/08/2022 0.10 $29.50|Phone call from Shermarian Resort Cabarita Pty Lt caveator's consent for leases.

BR Moira Hattingh Professional Services |Assets 1/09/2022 0.40 $46.00(Filing

Support
BR Moira Hattingh Professional Services |Assets 27/04/2023 0.30 $34.50(Filing
Support

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 23/09/2021 0.20 $127.00|reviewed correspondence from two investors regarding winding up of the fund/court
aonplication reaarding finalisation/reviewed/amended responses

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 28/09/2021 0.20 $127.00|reviewed court application filed and served by EL's liquidators regarding claims against
the Fund's assets

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 5/10/2021 0.10 $63.50|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding court hearing in respect of
indemnitv claims/reviewed draft order

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 12/10/2021 0.20 $127.00|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators
application/reviewed draft letter to EL liquidators solicitors/provided instructions
renardina came

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 14/10/2021 1.30 $825.50(|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators indemnity
claim/reviewed affidavit of liquidators solicitors/orders made at hearing on 1 October

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 22/10/2021 1.50 $952.50|reviewed EL liquidators points of claim/email our solicitors regarding response/issues to
be raised

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 27/10/2021 1.60 $1,016.00|reviewed EL liquidators Points of Claim/reviewed 2011 accounts/reviewed constitution in
relation to manaaer's riahts to management fee and expenses

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 3/11/2021 0.20 $127.00|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors and EL liquidators solicitors regarding
response to our solicitors letter/reasons why they won't provide information in support of
their indemnity application/draft orders for hearing tomorrow/sent response

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 4/11/2021 0.20 $127.00|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators indemnity
claim/application/draft orders for substituted service

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 4/11/2021 0.10 $63.50|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators indemnity claim and
outcome of court hearing/reviewed draft orders/forward to RW to prepare listing of
invactnre

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 15/11/2021 0.20 $127.00|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators indemnity
application/draft letter to EL liquidators solicitors regarding particulars overdue and
aueries in reenect of naints of claim/nrovided inctriictiong

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 19/11/2021 0.50 $317.50|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators indemnity
claim/reviewed particulars provided in support of points of claim/email our solicitors
renardina came

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 24/11/2021 0.50 $317.50(|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators Points of
Claim/reviewed Points of Claim/reviewed management accounts/sent resnonse

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 26/11/2021 0.10 $63.50|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators Points of
Claim/timing of response to same/reviewed draft letter to EL liquidators
colicitore/nrovided inctriictione reaardinag came

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 26/11/2021 0.90 $571.50|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding two queries relating to EL
Liquidators Points of Claim/reviewed Constitution/reviewed reports to members/reviewed
racainte and navmentc/raviewad accaiinte/cant racnnnce

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 3/12/2021 2.60 $1,651.00|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators indemnity
claim/reviewed Points of Claim/reviewed draft response/provided comments in respect of
came

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 3/12/2021 0.80 $508.00|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators Points of

Claim/reviewed draft replv/provided comments and instructions to finalise same




BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

6/12/2021

0.60

$381.00

reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators indemnity
application/reviewed updated reply to Points of Defence/reviewed draft letter to EL
liquidators solicitors regarding proposed way forward/reviewed draft court orders

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

7/12/2021

1.20

$762.00

reviewed counsels submissions in relation to directions hearing for EL liquidators
indemnity claims/reviewed claim relating to proof of debt process including timesheets

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

8/12/2021

0.20

$127.00

reviewed correspondence from our solicitors and EL liquidators solicitors regarding

hearing for indemnity application/reviewed proposed orders/provided instructions
reaardina same

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

8/12/2021

$63.50

reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding court hearing for EL liquidators
indemnitv application/provided instructions reaarding same

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

9/12/2021

0.20

$127.00

reviewed correspondence from our solicitors and EL liquidators solicitors regarding

indemnity application/reviewed draft letter and draft order in response/provided
inctriictinne reaardina came

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

17/12/2021

0.30

$190.50

reviewed correspondence from our solicitors and EL liquidators solicitors regarding

indemnity and separate question applications/reviewed draft court orders and supporting
affidavit

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

13/01/2022

2.20

$1,441.00

reviewed correspondence from the EL liquidators solicitors and our solicitors regarding

indemnity application/reviewed decisions relied on by the liquidators/reviewed draft
lattar tn El linnidatare enlicitare/nravidad inctriictinne

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

28/01/2022

1.10

$720.50

reviewed affidavit filed and served in respect of EL liquidators application

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

16/02/2022

1.60

$1,048.00

reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators indemnity

claim/reviewed EL liquidators outline of argument/compared to previous positions/email
anr colicitors reaardinag came

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

16/02/2022

0.30

$196.50

reviewed correspondence from our solicitors and Hall Chadwick's solicitors regarding
indemnitv application/reviewed affidavit

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

22/02/2022

0.30

$196.50

reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators indemnity
claim/reviewed draft letter to EL liquidators solicitors/application in respect of same

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

23/02/2022

$720.50

reviewed counsels submissions in respect of EL liquidators indemnity application/provided
instriictions in resnect of same

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

23/02/2022

$65.50

reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators indemnity

application/reviewed draft email regarding settlement of EL proceedings/provided
inctriictione reaardinag came

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

24/02/2022

0.40

$262.00

reviewed final draft of counsels submissions regarding EL liquidators indemnity
anplication/provided instructions reaardina same

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

24/02/2022

0.90

$589.50

reviewed updated counsels submissions regarding EL liquidators indemnity

application/telephone call with our solicitors/reviewed documentation/sent response to
ouir enlicitare/raviewad annlicatinn far adinnirnmaent and affidawvite

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

25/02/2022

0.30

$196.50

teleconference with our solicitors and counsel regarding outcome of court hearing today
in respect of EL liquidators adjournment application and indemnity application

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

25/02/2022

0.20

$131.00

reviewed counsels submissions regarding EL liquidators application to adjourn hearing of
indemnitv application/provided instructions reaarding same

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

1/03/2022

1.20

$786.00

reviewed transcript of court hearing of adjournment of separate questions application in
respect of Fl liauidators indemnitv application

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

4/03/2022

0.60

$393.00

reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators indemnity
claim/reviewed draft letter to EL liquidators solicitors regarding separate questions
application and progression of indemnity application/provided instructions

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

16/03/2022

0.20

$131.00

reviewed correspondence from EL liquidators solicitors and our solicitors regarding

further steps in the EL liquidators indemnity application/reviewed draft letter/provided
inctriictinne reaardina came

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

9/05/2022

0.30

$196.50

telephone call with our solicitors regarding Hall Chadwick's indemnity claim/progression
of same




BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 13/05/2022 0.20 $131.00|reviewed correspondence from Hall Chadwick's solicitors regarding further delays in
advising of their position on the indemnity claim/reviewed file regarding previous hearing
date/reviewed draft response/provided instructions regarding response

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 24/05/2022 0.20 $131.00|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors and EL liquidators regarding indemnity
claim/sent response in relation to broaressina the matter

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 27/06/2022 0.70 $458.50|reviewed numerous change in details/transfer of units/deceased estate notifications and
transfers plus sunportina documentation/aboroved same

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 12/07/2022 0.40 $262.00|meeting with our solicitors regarding EL liquidators claims/meeting to be held in respect
of same

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 12/07/2022 0.50 $327.50|preparation for meeting with our solicitors regarding finalising claim from EL liquidators

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 13/07/2022 2.10 $1,375.50|reviewed material in relation to applications to finalise administration/prepared update to
investors

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 25/07/2022 0.10 $65.50|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators claims/progression
of outstanding applications/provided instructions regarding same

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 31/07/2022 0.40 $262.00|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors and EL liquidators solicitors regarding
indemnitv claim/nrenared resnonse

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 4/08/2022 0.50 $327.50(|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators claims/reviewed
draft application and supporting affidavit/provided instructions in relation to progression
of the matter

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 8/08/2022 0.10 $65.50(|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators indemnity
claim/potential apolication to court to dismiss proceedinas

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 11/08/2022 0.30 $196.50|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators indemnity
claims/reviewed two draft letters/nrovided instructions reaarding same

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 11/08/2022 0.10 $65.50(|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors/updated drafts of two letters to EL
liauidators solicitors reaardina claims aaainst the Fund/provided instructions

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 2/09/2022 0.40 $262.00(telephone call with our solicitors regarding correspondence received from EL
liauidators/next stens/meetina to be held on 5 September

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 5/09/2022 0.80 $524.00]|teleconference with Hall Chadwick and Charles Haines regarding claims against the
fund/potential settlement/call with CH following meeting/email our solicitors regarding
cottlamant

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 6/09/2022 0.20 $131.00(|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding offer to settle claim against the
fund/reviewed terms/nrovided instructions reaardina same

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 6/09/2022 0.10 $65.50(|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors and EL liquidators solicitors regarding offer
to settle claims/reviewed draft response/provided instructions regarding same

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 20/09/2022 0.40 $262.00|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding settlement of EL liquidators
claims/reviewed deed of settlement/provided instructions regarding same

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 28/09/2022 0.30 $196.50(reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding updated draft deed of settlement
reaardina Fl liauidators claims/nrovided instriictions reaardina same

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 25/10/2022 0.30 $196.50(reviewed correspondence from our solicitors and EL liquidators solicitors regarding
proposed amendments to deed of settlement/email our solicitors regarding same

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 27/10/2022 0.50 $327.50(|reviewed deed of settlement/proposed changes/considered key issues/emailed our
salicitors

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 27/10/2022 0.20 $131.00[telephone call with our solicitors regarding deed of settlement/provided instructions
reaarding same

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 28/10/2022 0.20 $131.00|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding amendments to deed of
settlement/reviewed ubpdates to deed/pravided instructions reaarding same

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 3/11/2022 0.20 $131.00|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors and EL liquidators solicitors regarding
proposed amendments to deed of settlement/provided instructions regarding same

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 3/11/2022 0.20 $131.00(telephone call with our solicitors regarding deed of settlement/finalisation of same

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 30/11/2022 0.20 $131.00(|reviewed correspondence from investor regarding winding up/matters to finalise




BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 30/01/2023 0.30 $196.50|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding judicial advice
aonplication/reviewed draft application and draft affidavit

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 8/02/2023 0.70 $458.50|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators claims/reviewed my
draft affidavit and solicitors draft affidavit in respect of application for judicial
advica/nravided inctriictinne

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 8/02/2023 1.50 $982.50(reviewed affidavits and supporting documentation regarding judicial advice
annlication/resnonded to aueries raised bv ouir solicitors

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 8/02/2023 1.80 $1,179.00|detailed review of costs associated with dealing with EL liquidators claims for affidavit in
sunnort of iudicial advice annlication

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 8/02/2023 0.70 $458.50(|reviewed updated affidavit in support of judicial advice application/reviewed investor
correspondence relating to winding up/provided instructions regarding affidavit

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 13/02/2023 0.60 $393.00|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators claims and potential
claims against EL/reviewed previous affidavit in relation to claims/provided summary of
nncitinn cinca affidavit cwarn

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 15/02/2023 0.50 $327.50(teleconference with our solicitors and counsel regarding judicial advice application/issues
outstandina/finalisation of annlication

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 22/02/2023 1.10 $720.50(|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding judicial advice
application/reviewed draft affidavit/reviewed documentation relating to queries
raiced/nrovided inctriictiong

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 22/02/2023 1.20 $786.00|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors and counsel regarding judicial advice
aonplication/sent response

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 24/02/2023 0.80 $524.00|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding judicial advice
application/reviewed final drafts of material in support of the application/provided
inctriictinne

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 27/02/2023 0.60 $393.00(reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding judicial advice
application/reviewed application and supporting material/provided final instructions in
relation to affidavit

BR David Whyte Partner Creditors 13/03/2023 2.50 $1,637.50|attendance at court in relation to judicial advice application including meetings with our
salicitors and counsel

BR David Whyte Partner Creditors 13/03/2023 1.50 $982.50|attendance at court in relation to judicial advice application including meetings with our
salicitors and counsel

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 20/07/2021 0.40 $216.00|Review 15 letters and change of details forms to investors regarding updated details,
distributions. and review associated documentation

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 23/08/2021 0.10 $54.00|Review and approve three letters to investors and change of details, review associated
documentation

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 27/09/2021 0.20 $108.00(review five change of details requests and associated documentation

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 27/09/2021 0.10 $54.00|Review three letters to investors

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 29/09/2021 0.10 $54.00|Ph call to investors regarding update and change of details

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 8/10/2021 0.10 $54.00|Two letters to unit holder with updates regarding balances and additional documentation
reauired

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 15/10/2021 0.20 $108.00|nine letters to investors regarding update and change of details - review associated
documentation

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 15/10/2021 0.10 $54.00|Four letters to investors regarding update and change of details - review associated
documentation

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 15/10/2021 0.10 $54.00|Four letters to investors regarding update and change of details - review associated
documentation

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 25/10/2021 0.20 $108.00(Five letters to investors regarding unit balance calculations and additional information
required to update unit holdings. Review associated calculation workpapers and
ciinnartina material nrovidad hv invectare

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 25/10/2021 0.40 $216.00{Complex investor query - review background and liquidator reports regarding litigation to
nrovide resnonse

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 25/10/2021 0.10 $54.00|Review and authorise change of details, review complex letter regarding investor query
regarding litigation funding and insolvent trading claim by liquidator - obtain additional
infarmation for renlv

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 25/10/2021 0.10 $54.00(|Three letters to investors regarding unit balances updates and reprocessing of previous

distributions




BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 28/10/2021 0.10 $54.00|Review two letters to investors regarding update and litigation

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 28/10/2021 0.10 $54.00|Three change of investors details, including deceased estate of joint unitholders, review
associated documentation

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 1/11/2021 0.10 $54.00|Three Change of details requests

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 1/11/2021 0.10 $54.00|Three letters to investors regarding change of details and unit balance updates

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 1/11/2021 0.10 $54.00|Three letters to investors regarding change of details and additional information required
to undate database

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 4/11/2021 0.20 $108.00|Five letters and change of details from investors regarding updates and unit balance
confirmations

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 5/11/2021 0.10 $54.00|Review three letters to investors regarding updates and additional information required
to undate database

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 8/11/2021 0.10 $54.00|Review email from solicitors regarding court orders and mailing list

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 11/11/2021 0.10 $54.00|Review letters and change of details request for investors

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 16/11/2021 0.10 $54.00|Review three letters to investors regarding update and unit balance calculations

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 21/12/2021 0.20 $108.00|Eleven letters to investors regarding updates and change of details forms

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 29/03/2022 0.30 $166.50[21 letters to investors regarding documentation to update unit holdings and updates

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 29/03/2022 0.10 $55.50]|three letters to investors regarding documentation to update unit holdings and updates

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 11/04/2022 0.10 $55.50](three letters to investors regarding updates

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 21/04/2022 0.10 $55.50(five letters to investors

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 29/04/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review and approve two letters to investors

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 17/05/2022 0.20 $111.00|Review 7letters to investors regarding unit balance updates, general updates and
additional information reauired to undate investor database

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 17/05/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review 3 letters to investors regarding unit balance updates, general updates and
additional information reauired to undate investor database

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 18/07/2022 0.20 $111.00|Review creditors update

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 19/07/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review two letters to investors regarding updates and additional information required to
undate investor database

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 21/07/2022 0.20 $111.00(4 letters to investors regarding updates and dividend

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 26/07/2022 0.10 $55.50][three letters to investors regarding unit balance update and change of details

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 27/07/2022 0.10 $55.50|Two letters to investors regarding updates and change of details, review associated
documentation

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 5/08/2022 0.10 $55.50(4 letters to investors regarding change of details and estimated value of investments

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 5/08/2022 0.20 $111.00[Six letters to investors regarding change of details, and updates in relation to
administration

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 15/08/2022 0.20 $111.00|Six change of details forms and letters to investors regarding documentation to update
details. Review associated documentation and database extracts

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 16/08/2022 0.10 $55.50(|Three letters to investors regarding additional information to update investor database

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 19/08/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review and approve three letters to investors regarding updates and additional
information reauired

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 22/08/2022 0.10 $55.50[Review and approve email to investor

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 26/08/2022 0.10 $55.50]|three letters to investors regarding updates and change of details

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 5/09/2022 0.60 $333.00|Teleconference with Hall Chadwick regarding proceedings

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 5/09/2022 0.40 $222.00|Post meeting discussion with appointee and file note regarding meeting and proposed
settlement

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 5/09/2022 0.20 $111.00|Meeting pre conference with appointee

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 7/09/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review correspondence to Liquidator regarding update




BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 7/09/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review legal correspondence and update

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 9/09/2022 0.10 $55.50|Three letters to investors regarding updates and change of details

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 14/09/2022 0.10 $55.50{Two letters to investors, multiple holdings, regarding unit balance updates

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 15/09/2022 0.10 $55.50|Email and update regarding query regarding status and update staff

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 27/09/2022 0.10 $55.50(3 letters and change of details forms regarding unit holders updates. Review associated
documentation

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 17/10/2022 0.10 $55.50|Two letters to investors regarding updated and unit balance updates, inc investor with
multiple holdinas. Review calculations and database extracts

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 17/10/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review change of details of deceased estate and split of holdings into 4. Review
will/probate and additional documentation (client details, transfer forms and ID) x 4 for
noaw haldinac

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 17/10/2022 0.10 $55.50|Two letters to unit holders regarding updates and change of details

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 24/10/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review correspondence to investor with multiple investments regarding update and unit
balance undate on each investment

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 23/11/2022 0.20 $111.00(|Three letters to investors regarding updates and change of details, review associated
documentation reaardina database indates

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 12/12/2022 0.10 $55.50|Three change of details forms from investors, review database extracts

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 13/12/2022 0.20 $111.00|Eleven letters to investors regarding returned mail

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 16/12/2022 0.80 $444.00(24 Letters to investors regarding returned mail and requests to update investor details
via alternate contact details

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 16/12/2022 0.50 $277.50(15 Letters to investors regarding returned mail and requests to update investor details
via alternate contact details

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 16/12/2022 0.70 $388.50(22 Letters to investors regarding returned mail and requests to update investor details
via alternate contact details

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 23/01/2023 0.30 $166.50(Six letters to investors regarding updates, and change of details forms regarding unit
reauests

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 27/01/2023 0.40 $222.00(|Eleven change of details and letters to investors regarding updates and changes of
details. review associated documentation

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 27/01/2023 0.20 $111.00(9 change of details and letters to investors regarding updates and changes of details,
review associated documentation

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 1/02/2023 0.20 $111.00(5 change of details forms and letters, review associated documentation and database
extracts.

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 9/02/2023 0.10 $55.50|Arrange IT access for staff preparation of responses to investors

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 2/03/2023 0.20 $111.00|Review and approve 8 letters to investors regarding updates and change of details
forms. review associated documentation and database extracts

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 3/03/2023 0.10 $55.50|Review 4 letters and change of details forms, associated documentation and database
extracts

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 20/03/2023 0.10 $55.50(|Three letters to investors regarding updates and change of details, review associated
documentation and database extracts

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 20/03/2023 0.10 $55.50|Four letters to investors regarding updates and change of details

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 28/03/2023 0.40 $222.00(33 letters to investors regarding returned mail and updates to database, review
associated database extracts

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 13/04/2023 0.20 $108.00[Review 5 change of details forms and associated documentation

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 17/04/2023 0.10 $54.00](3 letters and change of details forms. Review associated documentation and database
extracts

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 21/04/2023 0.20 $108.00(Eleven Letters and change of details forms regarding updates, unit balance updates,
confirmation of changes. review associated documentation and database extracts

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 1/07/2021 0.60 $309.00|Liaise with Ryan Whyte re various affidavit queries in order to finalise same. Make
amendments to material

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 1/07/2021 2.40 $1,236.00|Update amendments to draft affidavits to finalise winding up and deal with equalisation

payments. Prepare responses to all queries from David Whyte and Gadens in relation to
draft material. Email to David Whyte for approval to send to Gadens.




BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 1/07/2021 0.40 $206.00]|Liaise with Ryan Whyte re various affidavit queries in order to finalise same. Make
amendments to material

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 2/07/2021 0.10 $51.50|Kwik copy quote request review, approval of email send

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 2/07/2021 0.80 $412.00|Meeting with Ryan Whyte re equalisation payment affidavit, final distribution calculations
etc

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 2/07/2021 0.10 $51.50|Instructions to Ryan Whyte re updating final distribution calculations.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 5/07/2021 1.10 $566.50|Review investigations undertaken by Ryan Whyte into Hardship payments and potential
set-off of same. Prepare summary in relation to set-off matters and recommendation to
ramnve from annalicatinn navment calcuilatinne

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 5/07/2021 1.50 $772.50|{Update and email draft response to Gadens queries with amendments to affidavit
material and instructions to prepare advice on various matters. Reply email to David
Whvte's fiirther alieries re material

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 6/07/2021 0.60 $309.00[Make further updates to draft affidavit material and finalise draft email to Gadens
regarding review of same and additional queries. Email draft email to David Whyte for
annraval tn raleace and nate additinnal aneriec

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 6/07/2021 0.90 $463.50|Update draft email to Gadens regarding review of 3x affidavits and Court application
documents to finalise windina un and deal with remainina matters.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 6/07/2021 0.30 $154.50|Review and consider final accounts requirement for winding up fund. Email to David
Whvte nrovidina details of review and oninion as to reauirements.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 7/07/2021 0.10 $51.50|Update and send email to Gadens re review/amendments to 4x affidavits

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 9/07/2021 0.20 $103.00(T/c from Gadens re clarification in relation to set-off removal from equalisation payment
affidavit.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 12/07/2021 0.10 $51.50|Meeting with Gadens re affidavit amendments

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 13/07/2021 0.10 $51.50|T/c from Gadens re affidavit clarification.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 16/07/2021 0.70 $360.50|Prepare estimate of costs for preparation of financial accounts for duration of
receivership. Liaise with Ryan Whyte re processes to complete same and email BDO
Avdit reaniectina meetina to fiirther review came

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 27/07/2021 1.80 $927.00|Review email from Gadens re amended draft material for application to court to finalise
receivership and pay equalisation payment. Review updated equalisation and final
distribution payments and liaise with Ryan Whyte re specific queries. Amend material

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 2/08/2021 0.10 $51.50|T/c Gadens re quote for sending auditor report and final accounts to investors. Liaise
with Rvan Whvte to obtain same from Kwik Kopv

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 2/08/2021 0.60 $309.00|Review and update equalisation payment affidavit material.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 3/08/2021 0.10 $51.50|Review and update draft email to Gadens re Kwik Kopy quotes summary.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 3/08/2021 0.10 $51.50|Review draft email and provide instructions to Ryan Whyte to amend email to Gadens re
summarising Kwik Kopv auotes for printina affidavit material

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 4/08/2021 0.40 $206.00|Meeting with Ryan Whyte re amendments to equalisation payment calculation
methodoloav for hardshin recibients

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 4/08/2021 0.20 $103.00][telephone call with David Whyte and Ryan Whyte regarding equalisation payment
calculations/finalisation of affidavit reaarding same

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 4/08/2021 0.40 $206.00|Meeting with Ryan Whyte re amended equalisation payment affidavit for hardship related
calculations. Review/update amendments and email to David Whyte.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 4/08/2021 0.10 $51.50|Reply email David Whyte re affidavit material review.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 5/08/2021 0.10 $51.50|Consider email from David Whyte re equalisation payment calculation queries. Arrange
teleconference to further discliss same.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 5/08/2021 0.10 $51.50|Review email from Ryan Whyte re equalisation payment calculation and affidavit
undates. Renlv email arranaina meetina to further disciiss same.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 5/08/2021 0.20 $103.00[Meeting with David Whyte and Ryan Whyte re equalisation payment calculation queries
and clarification.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 6/08/2021 0.70 $360.50(Finalise review of updated equalisation payment affidavit material and meeting. Update

draft email to Gadens re amendments, including to Linda Rickard affidavit. Email to
David Whwvte ta annrove came




BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 6/08/2021 1.10 $566.50|Review updated equalisation payment affidavit material and meeting with Ryan Whyte re
finalising same and review of Linda Rickard affidavit for hardship payment change of
mathadalanv imnacte

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 6/08/2021 0.10 $51.50|T/c Gadens re update on finalisation of equalisation payment affidavit material.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 6/08/2021 0.20 $103.00[Meeting with Ryan Whyte re hardship calculation amendments to equalisation payment.
Snot check review amendments made to 94 denasit TDs.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 6/08/2021 1.00 $515.00[{Meeting with Ryan Whyte re hardship calculation amendments to equalisation payment.
Snot check review amendments made to 94 denasit TDs.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 9/08/2021 0.20 $103.00(T/c from Gadens re amendments to affidavit, calculation methodology for hardship
navments and recommendation not to amend | inda Rickard affidavit.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 9/08/2021 0.20 $103.00[Review David Whyte's amendments to equalisation payment affidavit and update and
send email to Gadens re same and finalisina material for swearina.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 9/08/2021 0.20 $103.00[Meeting with David Whyte and Ryan Whyte re equalisation payment affidavit
amendments and undated calculations. Run throuah summary.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 11/08/2021 0.10 $51.50|T/c from Gadens re manual adjustment clarification for finalising affidavit material.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 1/09/2021 0.10 $51.50|Review Boddice orders and instructions from Gadens to notify investors of same.
Instriictions to Rvan Whvte to commence nrocess and uinload to wehsite.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 8/09/2021 0.10 $51.50|Phone call from Gadens re substituted service update.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 7/12/2021 0.10 $51.50|Review and approve 2x letters to investors re change of details requests.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 22/12/2021 0.30 $154.50[{Review and amend/approve 6x checklists/letters to investors/advisors re unit balances,
transfer of units. undate of details.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 20/01/2022 0.80 $424.00[Review, amend and approve 13 letters to investors/advisors re tfr of units, change of
details and unit balance requests. Review supporting docs. Review and approve 1x
navment reauicitiong for renrocecsina of dictribiitiong

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 22/02/2022 0.10 $53.00|Review and approve letters to investors re change of details/tfr of units.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 9/03/2022 0.30 $159.00|Review and amend/approve 5x letters to investors re change of details and tfr of units.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 23/03/2022 0.10 $53.00|Review and approve corro to investors re unit holdings.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 30/05/2022 0.20 $106.00|Review and approve 3x letters to investors re update on unit balances.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 16/06/2022 0.10 $53.00|Review and approve 2x Itr to investors re update on fund.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 19/10/2022 0.10 $53.00|Review and approve correspondence to investor re unit holding balance request.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 21/11/2022 0.20 $106.00|Review and update draft email to person claiming to be an investor of the fund.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 7/02/2023 0.10 $53.00|Review and sign letter to investor re update on unit holdings and transfer of units.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 10/03/2023 0.10 $53.00[Review and approve correspondence to 2x investors re unit balance requests.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 13/03/2023 0.10 $53.00|Review and approve reply correspondence to investor re multiple investment accounts
balances and reauirements to chanae details and transfer units

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 13/03/2023 0.10 $53.00|Review and approve correspondence to investor re unit balance request and transfer of
units reauirements

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 17/03/2023 0.20 $106.00|Review and approve 3x letters to investors re tfr of units, and unit balance requests.
Review supportina documents and checklists

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 20/03/2023 0.40 $212.00|Review and approve 3x letters to investors re update on winding up, transfer of units.
Review supporting documents. Settle updated wording for response template in light of
linnidatar'e claime heaina recalved

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 28/03/2023 0.10 $53.00|Review and approve 2x letters to investors re unitholding balances and estimated future
distributions to be made.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 30/03/2023 0.30 $159.00|Review and approve 5x change of details checklists and supporting docs. Review and
annrove 2x renlv letters to investors re transfer of units.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 11/04/2023 0.30 $159.00[Meeting with Ryan Whyte to review estimated final distribution calculations.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 11/04/2023 0.20 $106.00(Brief review of affidavit material for equalisation payment and finalisation, instructions

from David to undate etc.




BR

Jayden Coulston

Senior Manager

Creditors

13/04/2023

0.70

$371.00

Meeting with Ryan Whyte to undertake review of updated final distribution calculations to
support court affidavit material. Query specific formulae and comparison to previous
estimate. Request additional supporting calculations where necessary. Approve.

BR

Jayden Coulston

Senior Manager

Creditors

20/04/2023

$53.00

Review and approve email to Intersoft re equalisation payment, practical considerations.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

2/07/2021

$28.50

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

7/07/2021

$28.50

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

7/07/2021

$28.50

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm

details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
aliery

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

12/07/2021

$28.50

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

12/07/2021

$57.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

12/07/2021

$28.50

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their

allary

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/07/2021

$28.50

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm

details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
aliery

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/07/2021

0.20

$57.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/07/2021

0.20

$57.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/07/2021

$28.50

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/07/2021

0.30

$85.50

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

19/07/2021

0.20

$57.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

19/07/2021

0.40

$114.00

2x Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

19/07/2021

0.20

$57.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

20/07/2021

0.10

$28.50

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

21/07/2021

0.30

$85.50

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

21/07/2021

0.30

$85.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracecc reaiiect ac nar the Fiind'e nalicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

21/07/2021

$28.50

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

21/07/2021

0.20

$57.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice
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BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

22/07/2021

$28.50

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

22/07/2021

$28.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/07/2021

$28.50

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/07/2021

$28.50

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/07/2021

0.30

$85.50

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/07/2021

0.60

$171.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to 4x transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracecc reaiiect ac nar the Fiind'e nalicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

3/08/2021

0.10

$28.50

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/08/2021

$28.50

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/08/2021

$28.50

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/08/2021

$57.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/08/2021

$28.50

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/08/2021

$28.50

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/08/2021

0.20

$57.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/08/2021

0.20

$57.00

Prepare letter to investor confirming update of details for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor manaagement database to review current details.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

11/08/2021

0.20

$57.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

11/08/2021

0.20

$57.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/08/2021

0.10

$28.50

Prepare letter to investor confirming update of details for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/08/2021

0.20

$57.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

18/08/2021

0.60

$171.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

19/08/2021

0.20

$57.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

19/08/2021

$28.50

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate
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BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

20/08/2021

0.30

$85.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

20/08/2021

0.30

$85.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

8/09/2021

0.20

$57.00

Phone call from investor in response to a confirmation of their request to transfer units.
Access investor management database to review current investor details and advise.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

9/09/2021

0.20

$57.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

9/09/2021

$28.50

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/09/2021

$28.50

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/09/2021

$28.50

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/09/2021

$28.50

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/09/2021

0.20

$57.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/09/2021

0.20

$57.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/09/2021

0.10

$28.50

Review debtor statement and reconcile to outstanding payments in MYOB.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/09/2021

0.10

$28.50

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

20/09/2021

$28.50

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

20/09/2021

$28.50

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their

allary

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/09/2021

0.20

$57.00

Phone call from investor in response to their request to transfer units from a superfund

to their personal name. Access investor management database to review current
invectar detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/09/2021

0.30

$85.50

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/10/2021

0.60

$171.00

2x Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from

a deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/10/2021

0.20

$57.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/10/2021

0.20

$57.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/10/2021

0.20

$57.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.
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BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/10/2021

$85.50

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/10/2021

$28.50

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/10/2021

$57.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/10/2021

$28.50

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/10/2021

0.20

$57.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

7/10/2021

0.20

$57.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/10/2021

$28.50

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm

details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
aliery

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/10/2021

$28.50

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/10/2021

$57.00

Prepare letter to investor confirming transfer of units for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor manaagement database to review current details.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/10/2021

$142.50

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

15/10/2021

0.30

$85.50

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

20/10/2021

0.20

$57.00

Prepare letter to investor confirming transfer of units for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor manaagement database to review current details.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

20/10/2021

0.20

$57.00

Prepare letter to investor confirming update of details for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor manaagement database to review current details.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

20/10/2021

$142.50

3x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

20/10/2021

$142.50

3x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

20/10/2021

$28.50

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm

details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
aliery

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

27/10/2021

0.10

$28.50

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/11/2021

0.20

$57.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/11/2021

$28.50

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their

allary

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

2/11/2021

0.60

$171.00

3x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

2/11/2021

0.20

$57.00

Prepare letter to investor confirming update of details for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details

13



BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

3/11/2021

0.10

$28.50

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

5/11/2021

0.20

$57.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

8/11/2021

$28.50

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

8/11/2021

0.30

$85.50

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/11/2021

0.60

$171.00

3x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/11/2021

0.20

$57.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

11/11/2021

0.60

$171.00

3x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

12/11/2021

0.20

$57.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

15/11/2021

0.20

$57.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/11/2021

$28.50

Calls from investors /advisors
Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/11/2021

0.30

$85.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracecc reaiiect ac nar the Fiind'e nalicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/11/2021

0.80

$228.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/11/2021

$142.50

2x Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/11/2021

$114.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/12/2021

$142.50

3x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/12/2021

0.30

$85.50

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiind'e nalicyv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/12/2021

0.70

$199.50

4x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/12/2021

0.30

$85.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracece reaiiect ac nar tha Fiind'e nalicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/12/2021

0.20

$57.00

Prepare letter to investor confirming transfer of units for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor manaagement database to review current details.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/12/2021

0.20

$57.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/12/2021

0.20

$57.00

Prepare letter to investor confirming transfer of units for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details
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BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 1/12/2021 0.10 $28.50|Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
allary

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 1/12/2021 0.10 $28.50|Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a
deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 1/12/2021 0.30 $85.50|Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased
estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracece reaiiect ac nar the Fiind'e nalicy

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 2/12/2021 0.20 $57.00|2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.
Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 3/12/2021 0.30 $85.50|2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.
Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 21/12/2021 0.30 $85.50|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 21/12/2021 0.10 $28.50|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 21/12/2021 0.20 $57.00[Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.
Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 21/12/2021 0.10 $28.50|Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
allary

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 21/12/2021 0.40 $114.00|{Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 21/12/2021 0.40 $114.00(2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.
Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 22/12/2021 0.40 $114.00|Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 23/12/2021 0.40 $114.00|Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 23/12/2021 1.10 $313.50|Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 10/01/2022 0.40 $140.00|2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.
Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 10/01/2022 0.10 $35.00|Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
aliery

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 12/01/2022 0.60 $210.00(|3x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.
Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 12/01/2022 0.20 $70.00|Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a
deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 12/01/2022 0.40 $140.00|2x Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 12/01/2022 0.60 $210.00(3x Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the
Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nracecc tn 1indate

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 13/01/2022 0.10 $35.00|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 13/01/2022 0.20 $70.00|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 13/01/2022 0.10 $35.00|Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm

details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their

allary
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BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

13/01/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/01/2022

0.30

$105.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/01/2022

$175.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/01/2022

1.20

$420.00

6x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/01/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Prepare letter to investor on update of the winding up of the Fund. Access investor
manaagement database to review current details.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/01/2022

0.40

$140.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/01/2022

0.60

$210.00

3x Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/01/2022

0.20

$70.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the interim distribution to investors. Access
investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their request

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/01/2022

$175.00

Phone call with Ryan Whyte regarding next report to investors, winding up of the fund
template letters and proaression of court application

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

18/01/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

20/01/2022

0.20

$70.00

Prepare letter to investor confirming update of details for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor manaagement database to review current details.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

21/01/2022

0.30

$105.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

21/01/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/01/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/01/2022

0.20

$70.00

Prepare letter to investor confirming update of details for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/01/2022

0.10

$35.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/01/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

27/01/2022

0.30

$105.00

Prepare payment of website hosting fees in MYOB and NAB. Send to JC/CH for review.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

27/01/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiind'e nolicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

27/01/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/01/2022

$35.00

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm

details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
aliery

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/01/2022

$35.00

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their

allary
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BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/01/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/01/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/01/2022

0.20

$70.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/01/2022

0.20

$70.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

31/01/2022

0.20

$70.00

Prepare payment of FinPOWER invoice in MYOB and NAB. Email to CH/JC to
review/annroval.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

31/01/2022

0.20

$70.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

31/01/2022

0.10

$35.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

31/01/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

31/01/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/02/2022

0.20

$70.00

Prepare letter to investor on update of the winding up of the Fund. Access investor
management database to review current details

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/02/2022

0.30

$105.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracece reaiiect ac nar the Fiind'e nalicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/02/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/02/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/02/2022

$35.00

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm

details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
aliery

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/02/2022

$35.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/02/2022

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

18/02/2022

$35.00

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their

allary

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

18/02/2022

$105.00

2x Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from

a deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

18/02/2022

$175.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracece reaiiect ac nar the Fiind'e nalicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

22/02/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/02/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv
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BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/02/2022

0.20

$70.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/02/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/02/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/03/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/03/2022

0.30

$105.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiind'e nalicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/03/2022

$175.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/03/2022

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

3/03/2022

$175.00

2x Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

3/03/2022

$175.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracece reaiiect ac nar the Fiind'e nalicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

3/03/2022

0.70

$245.00

3x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

4/03/2022

0.30

$105.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac naer the Fiind'e nalicyv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

4/03/2022

0.80

$280.00

4x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

7/03/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

7/03/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiind'e nolicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

7/03/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracecc reaiiect ac nar the Fiind'e nalicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

8/03/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

8/03/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

9/03/2022

0.30

$105.00

Phone call with RW re Fund timeline and outcome of latest Court days.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/03/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

11/03/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv
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BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/03/2022

0.30

$105.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

15/03/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/03/2022

0.30

$105.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/03/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/03/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/03/2022

0.30

$105.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/03/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

18/03/2022

0.40

$140.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

21/03/2022

0.70

$245.00

3x Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

21/03/2022

0.20

$70.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

22/03/2022

0.20

$70.00

2x Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/03/2022

0.10

$35.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/03/2022

$35.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/03/2022

0.30

$105.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/03/2022

0.20

$70.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/03/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/03/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/03/2022

0.20

$70.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/03/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/03/2022

0.20

$70.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/03/2022

$35.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy
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BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/03/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/03/2022

0.20

$70.00

Prepare letter to investor on update of the winding up of the Fund. Access investor
manaagement database to review current details.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/03/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiind'e nolicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/03/2022

0.20

$70.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/03/2022

0.10

$35.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaaement database and advise

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

29/03/2022

0.60

$210.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

29/03/2022

1.20

$420.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

29/03/2022

$525.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

29/03/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

31/03/2022

1.00

$350.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

4/04/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

8/04/2022

$175.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

12/04/2022

$35.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

12/04/2022

0.20

$70.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

12/04/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracecc reaiiect ac nar the Fiind'e nalicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

12/04/2022

0.70

$245.00

3x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

12/04/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from

a deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

13/04/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/04/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/04/2022

0.30

$105.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/04/2022

0.30

$105.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/04/2022

0.30

$105.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/04/2022

0.70

$245.00

3x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracecc reaiiect ac nar the Fiind'e nalicy
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BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/04/2022

0.20

$70.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

19/04/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

22/04/2022

$35.00

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their

allary

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

22/04/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

26/04/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/04/2022

0.30

$105.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/05/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/05/2022

$35.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/05/2022

$35.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/05/2022

0.60

$210.00

3x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/05/2022

0.10

$35.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/05/2022

0.10

$35.00

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their

allary

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/05/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/05/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/05/2022

0.30

$105.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/05/2022

0.30

$105.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/05/2022

0.30

$105.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/05/2022

0.20

$70.00

Prepare letter to investor on update of the winding up of the Fund. Access investor
management database to review current details

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/05/2022

$35.00

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their

allary

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/05/2022

0.20

$70.00

Prepare letter to investor on update of the winding up of the Fund. Access investor
manaagement database to review current details.
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BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/05/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/05/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/05/2022

0.30

$105.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracece reaiiect ac nar the Fiind'e nalicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/05/2022

0.40

$140.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/05/2022

$35.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/05/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/05/2022

0.20

$70.00

Prepare letter to investor on update of the winding up of the Fund. Access investor
manaagement database to review current details.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/05/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiind'e nolicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

26/05/2022

0.20

$70.00

Phone call from investor in response to their request to transfer units from a superfund

to their personal name. Access investor management database to review current
invactar dataile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

26/05/2022

0.60

$210.00

3x Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

26/05/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Prepare letter to investor in response to their request to transfer units from a Super

Fund to their personal name. Access investor management database to review current
invactar dataile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/05/2022

$35.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/05/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracecc reaiiect ac nar the Fiind'e nalicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/05/2022

0.30

$105.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/05/2022

0.70

$245.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/05/2022

0.60

$210.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/06/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

22/06/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

22/06/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicyv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/06/2022

$175.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/06/2022

$35.00

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their

allary
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BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 24/06/2022 0.20 $70.00|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 4/07/2022 0.20 $70.00|Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.
Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 6/07/2022 0.20 $70.00|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 19/07/2022 0.40 $140.00(2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.
Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 2/08/2022 0.10 $35.00|Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
allary

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 2/08/2022 0.20 $70.00[Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.
Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 2/08/2022 0.20 $70.00|Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a
deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 15/08/2022 0.10 $35.00|Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
aliery

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 18/08/2022 0.10 $35.00|Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
allary

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 23/08/2022 0.10 $35.00|Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
aliery

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 26/08/2022 0.10 $35.00|Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
allary

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 2/09/2022 0.30 $105.00[Phone call from investor in response to their request to transfer units from a superfund
to their personal name. Access investor management database to review current
invectonr detaile and advice

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 5/09/2022 0.10 $35.00|Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
allary

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 5/09/2022 0.10 $35.00[Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 9/09/2022 0.10 $35.00[Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 9/09/2022 0.10 $35.00|Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
aliery

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 9/09/2022 0.10 $35.00|Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaaement database and advise

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 9/09/2022 0.40 $140.00[2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.
Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 9/09/2022 0.10 $35.00|Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
aliery

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 20/09/2022 0.20 $70.00|Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
nindate

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 29/09/2022 0.20 $70.00|Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv
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BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

29/09/2022

$35.00

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their

allary

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

7/12/2022

$35.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/12/2022

$175.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/12/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/12/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracece reaiiect ac nar the Fiind’c nalicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/12/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/12/2022

0.30

$105.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracece reaiiect ac nar the Fiind’c nalicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

19/12/2022

$35.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund’s mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund’s database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

19/12/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

21/12/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/01/2023

$35.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/01/2023

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/01/2023

0.20

$70.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/02/2023

$35.00

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm

details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
aliery

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/02/2023

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/02/2023

0.30

$105.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/02/2023

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracecce reaiiect ac nar the Fiind’c nalicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/02/2023

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiind’e nolicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

3/03/2023

0.30

$105.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

3/03/2023

$35.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.
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BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/03/2023

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiind’c nalicyv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/03/2023

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/03/2023

0.20

$70.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/03/2023

0.20

$70.00

Prepare letter to investor on update of the winding up of the Fund. Access investor
manaagement database to review current details.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/03/2023

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/03/2023

0.30

$105.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracece reaiiect ac nar the Fiind’c nalicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

7/03/2023

0.20

$70.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

7/03/2023

$35.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

8/03/2023

$35.00

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm

details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
aliery

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

13/03/2023

0.20

$70.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/03/2023

0.20

$70.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/03/2023

0.30

$105.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracece reaiiect ac nar the Fiind’c nalicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/03/2023

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/03/2023

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/03/2023

$35.00

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm

details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
aliery

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/03/2023

0.20

$70.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaaement database and advise

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/07/2021

1.20

$408.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post.

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/07/2021

1.20

$408.00

Prepare 6 letters to investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the
Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
process to update.

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

7/07/2021

0.60

$204.00

Prepare 3 letters to investors confirming update of details for their investment with the
Fund. Access investor management database to review current details.
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BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

7/07/2021

1.40

$476.00

Prepare 7 letters to investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the
Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
process to update.

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

8/07/2021

1.00

$340.00

Review of correspondence from 5 investors in relation to a change of details request.
Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
request as per the Funds policy.

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

22/07/2021

$374.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/07/2021

1.00

$340.00

Review of correspondence from 5 investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/07/2021

0.40

$136.00

Prepare 2 letters to investors confirming transfer of units for their investment with the
Fund. Access investor manaagement database to review current details.

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/07/2021

0.90

$306.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/07/2021

0.60

$204.00

Review of correspondence from 6 investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/07/2021

1.20

$408.00

Review of correspondence from 6 investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/07/2021

0.20

$68.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/07/2021

0.20

$68.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/08/2021

0.90

$306.00

Reviewed and approved 8 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/08/2021

0.60

$204.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/09/2021

0.40

$136.00

Prepare 2 letters to investors in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their

raaiiact

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/09/2021

0.70

$238.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

20/09/2021

0.80

$272.00

Prepare 4 letters to investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

20/09/2021

0.60

$204.00

Prepare 3 letters to investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

22/09/2021

0.40

$136.00

Prepare 2 letters to investors in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their

raaiiact

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/09/2021

0.60

$204.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to an investor in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/09/2021

0.30

$102.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

29/09/2021

0.20

$68.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice
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BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/10/2021

0.20

$68.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

5/10/2021

0.40

$136.00

Prepare 2 letters to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from

a deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

5/10/2021

0.30

$102.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/10/2021

0.80

$272.00

Prepare 4 letters to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from

a deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

7/10/2021

0.20

$68.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaaement database and advise

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

8/10/2021

0.30

$102.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

12/10/2021

0.60

$204.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

12/10/2021

$170.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

13/10/2021

$170.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

13/10/2021

$34.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

13/10/2021

0.30

$102.00

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their

allary

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

13/10/2021

1.00

$340.00

Reviewed and approved 9 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/10/2021

0.20

$68.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/10/2021

1.80

$612.00

Review of correspondence from 9 investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

20/10/2021

1.00

$340.00

Reviewed and approved 8 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

20/10/2021

0.20

$68.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

21/10/2021

1.00

$340.00

Reviewed and approved 10 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/10/2021

0.30

$102.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their

raaiiact

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/10/2021

$170.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

26/10/2021

0.40

$136.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their

raaiiact
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BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/10/2021

0.70

$238.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaaced actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

4/11/2021

1.00

$340.00

Reviewed and approved 9 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

4/11/2021

$714.00

Review of correspondence from 13 investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

5/11/2021

0.80

$272.00

Review of correspondence from 4 investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

5/11/2021

0.90

$306.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to an investor in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

5/11/2021

0.30

$102.00

Reviewed and approved 3 letters to an investor in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

8/11/2021

0.70

$238.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

9/11/2021

1.20

$408.00

Reviewed and approved 9 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/11/2021

0.30

$102.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their

raaiiact

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/11/2021

0.90

$306.00

Reviewed and approved 8 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

11/11/2021

0.80

$272.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

15/11/2021

0.60

$204.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

15/11/2021

0.80

$272.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

18/11/2021

0.40

$136.00

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm

details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
aliery

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

18/11/2021

0.30

$102.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

22/11/2021

0.80

$272.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to an investor in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

22/11/2021

0.20

$68.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinaly

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

22/11/2021

0.40

$136.00

Prepare 2 letters to investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/11/2021

$170.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to an investor in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata
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BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/11/2021

0.20

$68.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

2/12/2021

1.00

$340.00

Reviewed and approved 7 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

8/12/2021

0.60

$204.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

8/12/2021

$170.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/12/2021

$272.00

Reviewed and approved 7 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

20/12/2021

$374.00

Reviewed and approved 8 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

21/12/2021

0.20

$68.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

11/01/2022

0.70

$273.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/01/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/01/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinaly

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

15/02/2022

0.60

$234.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/02/2022

0.80

$312.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/03/2022

0.90

$351.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

18/03/2022

$429.00

Reviewed and approved 8 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

18/03/2022

$195.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

21/03/2022

$585.00

Reviewed and approved 15 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

21/03/2022

0.60

$234.00

Prepare 3 letters to investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

21/03/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinaly

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

22/03/2022

0.60

$234.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/03/2022

1.20

$468.00

Prepare 6 letters to investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate
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BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

29/03/2022

0.70

$273.00

Scanned multiple documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to
reauired investor via email or bost

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

29/03/2022

$195.00

Scanned multiple documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to
reauired investor via email or bost

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/04/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review March BAS and provide to Charles/Jayden for approval.

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

12/04/2022

0.90

$351.00

Reviewed and approved 7 letters to an investor in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

12/04/2022

0.80

$312.00

Review of correspondence from 4 investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

13/04/2022

0.70

$273.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to an investor in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/04/2022

1.00

$390.00

Reviewed and approved 7 letters to an investor in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/04/2022

0.70

$273.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to an investor in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

19/04/2022

0.80

$312.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

20/04/2022

1.30

$507.00

Reviewed and approved 9 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

26/04/2022

0.90

$351.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

4/05/2022

0.60

$234.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

5/05/2022

0.40

$156.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/05/2022

0.40

$156.00

Reviewed and approved 3 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/05/2022

0.70

$273.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/05/2022

0.60

$234.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/05/2022

1.20

$468.00

Reviewed and approved 8 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/05/2022

1.30

$507.00

Prepare the 37th update report to creditors, update legal matters, prepare receipts and
pavments and estimated return

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/05/2022

0.80

$312.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/05/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/05/2022

$39.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv
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BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/05/2022

0.80

$312.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaaced actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

27/05/2022

0.70

$273.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/05/2022

1.00

$390.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

31/05/2022

$195.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/06/2022

$195.00

Reviewed and approved 3 letters to an investor in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/06/2022

$195.00

Reviewed and approved 3 letters to an investor in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

3/06/2022

0.30

$117.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

3/06/2022

0.40

$156.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

9/06/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

13/06/2022

0.80

$312.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/06/2022

$195.00

Reviewed and approved 3 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

20/06/2022

$585.00

Prepare the 37th update report to creditors including legal proceedings, estimated return
and receints and navments.

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/06/2022

$312.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/07/2022

$429.00

Prepare receipts and payments for entire appointment to enter into the 37th update
renort to creditors

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/07/2022

$429.00

Reviewed and approved 9 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

11/07/2022

$429.00

Reviewed and approved 8 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

13/07/2022

$195.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

13/07/2022

0.90

$351.00

Update the 37th report to investors and send to our solicitors for review

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

18/07/2022

1.20

$468.00

Reviewed and approved 15 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

19/07/2022

1.00

$390.00

Reviewed and approved 14 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata
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BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

19/07/2022

0.80

$312.00

Reviewed and approved 9 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaaced actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

21/07/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/07/2022

0.20

$78.00

Prepare payment of invoice in INSOL6 and online banking

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/07/2022

1.10

$429.00

Reviewed and approved 9 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

26/07/2022

$195.00

Reviewed and approved 3 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

27/07/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

27/07/2022

0.80

$312.00

Reviewed and approved 7 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/07/2022

1.30

$507.00

Reviewed and approved 12 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/08/2022

0.60

$234.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

2/08/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinaly

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

2/08/2022

$195.00

Reviewed and approved 3 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

3/08/2022

$195.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

4/08/2022

$390.00

Reviewed change of details forms from 8 investors, prepared checklist and payment in
INSOL6 and online banking to reprocess the interim distribution to the investor

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

5/08/2022

$429.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

5/08/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

8/08/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

8/08/2022

0.90

$351.00

Reviewed and approved 8 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

11/08/2022

0.70

$273.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

12/08/2022

$429.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

12/08/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv
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BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

15/08/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

15/08/2022

1.00

$390.00

Reviewed and approved 8 letters to an investor in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/08/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/08/2022

$195.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to an investor in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/08/2022

$234.00

Reviewed and approved 7 letters to an investor in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/08/2022

$39.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

18/08/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

22/08/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

22/08/2022

1.40

$546.00

Reviewed and approved 10 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/08/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/08/2022

$195.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/08/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

26/08/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinaly

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

26/08/2022

0.60

$234.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

29/08/2022

0.80

$312.00

Reviewed and approved 7 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

29/08/2022

0.70

$273.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

29/08/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinaly

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/08/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/08/2022

0.70

$273.00

Reviewed and approved 7 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata
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BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

2/09/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

12/09/2022

0.90

$351.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

12/09/2022

$39.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

15/09/2022

0.80

$312.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

19/09/2022

1.00

$390.00

Reviewed and approved 7 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

26/09/2022

0.80

$312.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

27/09/2022

0.50

$195.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/09/2022

$195.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

29/09/2022

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

29/09/2022

$429.00

Reviewed and approved 8 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

4/10/2022

0.90

$351.00

Reviewed and approved 8 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

5/10/2022

1.00

$390.00

Reviewed and approved 8 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/10/2022

$429.00

Reviewed and approved 7 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/10/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/10/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/10/2022

1.20

$468.00

Reviewed and approved 7 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

11/10/2022

$429.00

Reviewed and approved 7 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

11/10/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

12/10/2022

0.70

$273.00

Reviewed and approved 7 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata
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BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/10/2022

0.30

$117.00

Reviewed and approved 3 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaaced actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/10/2022

1.00

$390.00

Reviewed and approved 7 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/10/2022

0.80

$312.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/10/2022

1.40

$546.00

Reviewed and approved 8 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

26/10/2022

0.60

$234.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

31/10/2022

1.00

$390.00

Reviewed and approved 8 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

2/11/2022

0.90

$351.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

2/11/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

8/11/2022

0.90

$351.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

9/11/2022

0.60

$234.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/11/2022

$195.00

Reviewed and approved 3 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

15/11/2022

$117.00

Reviewed and approved 3 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

15/11/2022

$195.00

Reviewed and approved 3 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/11/2022

$195.00

Reviewed and approved 3 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

11/01/2023

1.40

$546.00

Reviewed and approved 10 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

18/01/2023

0.50

$195.00

Prepare estimated return to finalisation

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

18/01/2023

1.40

$546.00

Reviewed and approved 14 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

20/01/2023

0.40

$156.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/01/2023

0.80

$312.00

Reviewed and approved 8 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/01/2023

1.20

$468.00

Prepare 6 letters to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from

a deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice
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BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/01/2023

1.20

$468.00

Prepare 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/01/2023

0.60

$234.00

Prepare 3 letters to investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

27/01/2023

1.60

$624.00

Prepare 8 letters to investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

27/01/2023

1.60

$624.00

Prepare 8 letters to executors of estate in response to their request to transfer units

from a deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/01/2023

0.90

$351.00

Reviewed and approved 9 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/01/2023

2.00

$780.00

Prepare 10 letters to investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

31/01/2023

0.90

$351.00

Reviewed and approved 9 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

3/02/2023

1.00

$390.00

Reviewed and approved 11 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/02/2023

1.40

$546.00

Reviewed and approved 13 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

7/02/2023

0.70

$273.00

Reviewed and approved 7 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

7/02/2023

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/02/2023

0.70

$273.00

Reviewed and approved 8 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

15/03/2023

$585.00

Reviewed and approved 14 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/03/2023

$429.00

Reviewed and approved 12 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

20/03/2023

0.60

$234.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

21/03/2023

0.60

$234.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

22/03/2023

0.90

$351.00

Reviewed and approved 12 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/03/2023

0.70

$273.00

Reviewed and approved 9 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/03/2023

$429.00

Reviewed and approved 9 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata
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BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

31/03/2023

0.80

$312.00

Reviewed and approved 7 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaaced actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

3/04/2023

0.90

$351.00

Reviewed and approved 8 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/04/2023

0.60

$234.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/04/2023

1.00

$390.00

Reviewed and approved 9 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/04/2023

$429.00

Reviewed and approved 11 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

19/04/2023

0.80

$312.00

Reviewed and approved 7 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

26/04/2023

0.60

$234.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

27/04/2023

1.20

$468.00

Reviewed and approved 13 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/04/2023

0.70

$273.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

19/08/2021

0.20

$46.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

19/08/2021

0.20

$46.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of trustee request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

19/08/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

19/08/2021

0.40

$92.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

19/08/2021

0.30

$69.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

19/08/2021

0.30

$69.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

19/08/2021

$115.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

20/08/2021

0.60

$138.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

20/08/2021

0.30

$69.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

20/08/2021

$115.00

2 x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicyv
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BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

20/08/2021

1.00

$230.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

20/08/2021

0.30

$69.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the trustee for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

20/08/2021

0.20

$46.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

20/08/2021

0.20

$46.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

23/08/2021

$115.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

24/08/2021

0.40

$92.00

Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

26/08/2021

1.00

$230.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

26/08/2021

$115.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

26/08/2021

0.20

$46.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

27/08/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their
reaiiect

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

30/08/2021

$23.00

Phone call from investor in response to their request to transfer units from a superfund

to their personal name. Access investor management database to review current
invactar dataile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

30/08/2021

$460.00

Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

31/08/2021

$23.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

2/09/2021

$23.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their

raaiiact

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/09/2021

$23.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

9/09/2021

0.40

$92.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

9/09/2021

0.60

$138.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/09/2021

0.20

$46.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

15/09/2021

$23.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

23/09/2021

$115.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

23/09/2021

0.20

$46.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

24/09/2021

0.20

$46.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

27/09/2021

0.30

$69.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.
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BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/10/2021

0.40

$92.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

6/10/2021

$115.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/10/2021

0.20

$46.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/10/2021

0.30

$69.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/10/2021

0.30

$69.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/10/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/10/2021

0.30

$69.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their
reaiiect

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/10/2021

$23.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/10/2021

$69.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/10/2021

$115.00

2 x Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/10/2021

0.40

$92.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/10/2021

0.20

$46.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/10/2021

$115.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/10/2021

0.30

$69.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/10/2021

0.30

$69.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

12/10/2021

$115.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units and unit
balance from a deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor
management database to review current investor details and advise.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

13/10/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their

raaiiact

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

13/10/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/10/2021

0.20

$46.00

Multiple preparing letters to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer
units from a deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor
mananament datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/10/2021

$23.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.
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BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/10/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

15/10/2021

0.30

$69.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their
reaiiect

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

18/10/2021

$23.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

18/10/2021

$23.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

18/10/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

18/10/2021

0.60

$138.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

18/10/2021

0.10

$23.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

18/10/2021

0.30

$69.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

18/10/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

18/10/2021

0.20

$46.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of trustee request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

18/10/2021

0.30

$69.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their

raaiiact

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

18/10/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

18/10/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

19/10/2021

$23.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

20/10/2021

0.30

$69.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

20/10/2021

0.30

$69.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

20/10/2021

0.40

$92.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

20/10/2021

0.10

$23.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

21/10/2021

0.30

$69.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

21/10/2021

0.20

$46.00

2 x Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

21/10/2021

0.20

$46.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv
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BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/10/2021

0.20

$46.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/10/2021

0.20

$46.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/10/2021

0.20

$46.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/10/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/10/2021

$23.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/10/2021

$23.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/10/2021

0.50

$115.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request for a unit balance and to
transfer units from a deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor
management database to review current investor details and advise.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/10/2021

0.20

$46.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracece reaiiect ac nar the Fiind'e nalicy

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/10/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their
reaiiect

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

25/10/2021

0.40

$92.00

6 x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

25/10/2021

$23.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

25/10/2021

$46.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

25/10/2021

$23.00

3 x Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

25/10/2021

$23.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

27/10/2021

$23.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

28/10/2021

$69.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

28/10/2021

$23.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

28/10/2021

$46.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

28/10/2021

$23.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

28/10/2021

$23.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate
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BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

1/11/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

2/11/2021

0.40

$92.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

2/11/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

2/11/2021

$23.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

2/11/2021

0.40

$92.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

2/11/2021

0.30

$69.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

2/11/2021

0.20

$46.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

2/11/2021

0.40

$92.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

3/11/2021

0.20

$46.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

3/11/2021

0.30

$69.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

4/11/2021

0.30

$69.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/11/2021

0.30

$69.00

12 x Reviewed and approved a checklist to an investor in relation to a request for a

change of details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer
of 1inite for deceaced ectate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/11/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare letter to investor confirming update of details for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/11/2021

0.30

$69.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/11/2021

0.30

$69.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/11/2021

$23.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/11/2021

$46.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/11/2021

$23.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/11/2021

0.30

$69.00

12 x Reviewed and approved a checklist to an investor in relation to a request for a

change of details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer
of 1inite for deceaced ectate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/11/2021

0.40

$92.00

12 x Reviewed and approved a checklist to an investor in relation to a request for a

change of details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer
of ninite for deceaced actate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/11/2021

$23.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/11/2021

$23.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.
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BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/11/2021

0.20

$46.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

9/11/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

9/11/2021

$23.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

9/11/2021

$23.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

9/11/2021

$46.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

10/11/2021

$23.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

10/11/2021

$69.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

10/11/2021

$23.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracecce reaiiect ac nar the Fiind'e nalicy

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

10/11/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

10/11/2021

0.30

$69.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

11/11/2021

$23.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

11/11/2021

$23.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

11/11/2021

$46.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

12/11/2021

$23.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

12/11/2021

$23.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

12/11/2021

$46.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

12/11/2021

$23.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

12/11/2021

$23.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

15/11/2021

0.20

$46.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

15/11/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice
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BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

15/11/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

15/11/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

15/11/2021

0.20

$46.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

18/11/2021

$23.00

Prepare letter to investor confirming update of details for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor manaagement database to review current details.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/11/2021

$23.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/11/2021

0.20

$46.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaaement database and advise

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

23/11/2021

0.30

$69.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

29/11/2021

0.20

$46.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiind'e nolicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

29/11/2021

$23.00

18 x Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

29/11/2021

0.40

$92.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

29/11/2021

0.30

$69.00

Prepare letter to investor confirming transfer of units for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

29/11/2021

0.30

$69.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

30/11/2021

0.20

$46.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

30/11/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

30/11/2021

$23.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

30/11/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

30/11/2021

0.30

$69.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

1/12/2021

0.30

$69.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

1/12/2021

$23.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

2/12/2021

$23.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaaement database and advise

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

2/12/2021

$23.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate
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BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

2/12/2021

$23.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/12/2021

0.40

$92.00

Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Call
investor to reauest new address details.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/12/2021

0.20

$46.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/12/2021

$23.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/12/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/12/2021

0.20

$46.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/12/2021

$23.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/12/2021

0.30

$69.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/12/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/12/2021

0.20

$46.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

9/12/2021

0.60

$138.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

9/12/2021

$115.00

15 x Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance.
Access investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

9/12/2021

$23.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

10/12/2021

$184.00

Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

10/12/2021

$46.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

13/12/2021

$23.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

15/12/2021

$23.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaaement database and advise

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

15/12/2021

$23.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

16/12/2021

0.20

$46.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

17/12/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the trustee for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

23/12/2021

0.20

$46.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

10/01/2022

0.20

$48.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

11/01/2022

$24.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice
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BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

11/01/2022

0.30

$72.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

11/01/2022

0.30

$72.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

12/01/2022

0.30

$72.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

12/01/2022

$24.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

12/01/2022

$24.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

12/01/2022

0.20

$48.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

12/01/2022

0.30

$72.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracece reaiiect ac nar the Fiind'e nalicy

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/01/2022

$24.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

19/01/2022

$24.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

24/01/2022

$24.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

24/01/2022

0.10

$24.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

27/01/2022

0.30

$72.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

27/01/2022

0.30

$72.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

28/01/2022

0.30

$72.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

2/02/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

2/02/2022

$24.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/02/2022

0.30

$72.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/02/2022

0.30

$72.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/02/2022

0.40

$96.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

11/02/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice
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BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

11/02/2022

0.20

$48.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

11/02/2022

$24.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/02/2022

$48.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/02/2022

$24.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/02/2022

0.20

$48.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/02/2022

0.20

$48.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

17/02/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

17/02/2022

$24.00

Prepare letter to investor on update of the winding up of the Fund. Access investor
management database to review current details

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/02/2022

0.20

$48.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/02/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/02/2022

0.30

$72.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/02/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/02/2022

0.20

$48.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/02/2022

0.20

$48.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/02/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/02/2022

$24.00

Prepare letter to investor on update of the winding up of the Fund. Access investor
management database to review current details

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/02/2022

$24.00

Prepare letter to investor on update of the winding up of the Fund. Access investor
management database to review current details

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/02/2022

$24.00

Prepare letter to investor on update of the winding up of the Fund. Access investor
management database to review current details

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/02/2022

$24.00

Prepare letter to investor on update of the winding up of the Fund. Access investor
manaagement database to review current details

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

24/02/2022

$24.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

25/02/2022

$24.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

25/02/2022

$24.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice
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BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

25/02/2022

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

28/02/2022

0.30

$72.00

Preparing payment to finPOWER for monthly license fee in MYOB and in NAB.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

28/02/2022

0.40

$96.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

2/03/2022

0.10

$24.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

3/03/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/03/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/03/2022

$24.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/03/2022

0.10

$24.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/03/2022

0.20

$48.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

9/03/2022

0.10

$24.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

9/03/2022

0.40

$96.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

10/03/2022

$24.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

11/03/2022

0.20

$48.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/03/2022

0.40

$96.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/03/2022

0.30

$72.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/03/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

17/03/2022

$24.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

17/03/2022

$24.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

17/03/2022

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracecc reaiiect ac nar the Fiind'e nalicy

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

17/03/2022

$24.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

17/03/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

18/03/2022

0.30

$72.00

Preparing MYOB and NAB requisition for payment to Gadens for February legal fees.
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BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

18/03/2022

$24.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

21/03/2022

0.20

$48.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

28/03/2022

0.10

$24.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

30/03/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

30/03/2022

0.20

$48.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

30/03/2022

0.10

$24.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

30/03/2022

0.10

$24.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

31/03/2022

$24.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/04/2022

0.30

$72.00

Preparing MYOB and NAB payment to finPOWER for monthly license fee.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/04/2022

0.30

$72.00

Preparing MYOB and NAB payment to Gadens for legal fees.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

6/04/2022

0.10

$24.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/04/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their
reaiiect

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/04/2022

0.30

$72.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/04/2022

0.40

$96.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/04/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to investor confirming transfer of units for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/04/2022

0.20

$48.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/04/2022

$24.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/04/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/04/2022

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/04/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

11/04/2022

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

11/04/2022

0.10

$24.00

Call from an adviser seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

11/04/2022

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracece reaiiect ac nar the Fiind'e nalicy
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BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

12/04/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to investor confirming update of details for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

13/04/2022

0.30

$72.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

13/04/2022

0.30

$72.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

13/04/2022

0.30

$72.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

13/04/2022

$24.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinaly

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

13/04/2022

0.40

$96.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

13/04/2022

0.30

$72.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/04/2022

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/04/2022

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

19/04/2022

$24.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

19/04/2022

$24.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

19/04/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

19/04/2022

0.20

$48.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

21/04/2022

$24.00

Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

21/04/2022

$24.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

21/04/2022

$24.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/04/2022

$24.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/04/2022

0.20

$48.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/04/2022

0.50

$120.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/04/2022

0.40

$96.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/04/2022

$24.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

26/04/2022

0.40

$96.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracece reaiiect ac nar the Fiind'e nalicy
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BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

27/04/2022

$120.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

27/04/2022

$24.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

28/04/2022

0.30

$72.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

3/05/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to investor on update of the winding up of the Fund. Access investor
manaagement database to review current details.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

3/05/2022

0.30

$72.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

3/05/2022

0.30

$72.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

4/05/2022

$24.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

4/05/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/05/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/05/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/05/2022

$120.00

5 x Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/05/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/05/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/05/2022

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/05/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/05/2022

0.30

$72.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/05/2022

0.30

$72.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/05/2022

0.20

$48.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/05/2022

0.30

$72.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

6/05/2022

0.40

$96.00

Prepare letter to investor on update of the winding up of the Fund. Access investor
manaagement database to review current details.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

6/05/2022

0.30

$72.00

Prepare letter to investor on update of the winding up of the Fund. Access investor
manaagement database to review current details.
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BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 6/05/2022 0.10 $24.00|Phone call from investor in response to a confirmation of their request to transfer units.
Access investor management database to review current investor details and advise.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 6/05/2022 0.10 $24.00|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 10/05/2022 0.50 $120.00(2 x Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 11/05/2022 0.10 $24.00|Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be
updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinaly

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 11/05/2022 0.10 $24.00|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 11/05/2022 0.30 $72.00|Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 13/05/2022 0.20 $48.00|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 13/05/2022 0.20 $48.00|Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 13/05/2022 0.10 $24.00|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 17/05/2022 0.10 $24.00|Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 18/05/2022 0.30 $72.00|Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.
Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 18/05/2022 0.20 $48.00|Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 19/05/2022 0.60 $144.00|Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 1/06/2022 0.10 $24.00|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 1/06/2022 0.30 $72.00|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 6/06/2022 0.20 $48.00|Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
nndate

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 7/06/2022 0.10 $24.00|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 7/06/2022 0.20 $48.00|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 15/06/2022 0.20 $48.00|Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a
deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 16/06/2022 0.10 $24.00|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 16/06/2022 0.30 $72.00|Prepare letter to investor on update of the winding up of the Fund. Access investor
manaagement database to review current details.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 27/06/2022 0.20 $48.00|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 28/06/2022 0.10 $24.00[Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 5/07/2022 0.30 $72.00|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 6/07/2022 0.20 $48.00|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 6/07/2022 0.20 $48.00|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 7/07/2022 0.20 $48.00[Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 7/07/2022 0.20 $48.00|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 8/07/2022 0.20 $48.00|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.
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BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/07/2022

1.40

$336.00

Building asset impairments master spreadsheet for purposes of financial accounts for
impairments of the loans

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/07/2022

0.40

$96.00

Building asset impairments master spreadsheet for purposes of financial accounts for
impairments of the loans

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

13/07/2022

0.20

$48.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaaement database and advise

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

13/07/2022

0.30

$72.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

20/07/2022

0.60

$144.00

3 x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

20/07/2022

0.20

$48.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

21/07/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/07/2022

0.20

$48.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/07/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

26/07/2022

$29.50

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

28/07/2022

0.30

$88.50

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

28/07/2022

0.20

$59.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their

raaiiact

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

28/07/2022

$29.50

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

29/07/2022

0.50

$147.50

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

29/07/2022

0.10

$29.50

Call from an investor seeking information in regards to the interim distribution from the
fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

1/08/2022

0.30

$88.50

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

1/08/2022

0.20

$59.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

1/08/2022

0.30

$88.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

1/08/2022

0.40

$118.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

1/08/2022

0.40

$118.00

Prepare letters to investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

1/08/2022

0.40

$118.00

Prepare letters to investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

1/08/2022

0.40

$118.00

Prepare letters to investors in response to their request to transfer units from a Super

Fund to their personal name. Access investor management database to review current
invectar detaile and advice
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BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

3/08/2022

$147.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

3/08/2022

0.20

$59.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

4/08/2022

0.30

$88.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

4/08/2022

0.30

$88.50

Prepare letters to investors in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/08/2022

0.30

$88.50

Prepare letters to investors in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/08/2022

0.20

$59.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

9/08/2022

0.10

$29.50

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

11/08/2022

0.10

$29.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

11/08/2022

0.20

$59.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

11/08/2022

0.30

$88.50

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

15/08/2022

0.40

$118.00

Phone call from investor in response to a confirmation of their request to change details.
Access investor management database to review current investor details and advise.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

17/08/2022

0.20

$59.00

Prepare letter to investor on update of the winding up of the Fund. Access investor
management database to review current details

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

17/08/2022

0.20

$59.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

17/08/2022

0.40

$118.00

2 x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

18/08/2022

0.30

$88.50

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

18/08/2022

0.30

$88.50

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

18/08/2022

0.30

$88.50

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

23/08/2022

0.20

$59.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

24/08/2022

0.50

$147.50

Prepare letters to investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

25/08/2022

0.30

$88.50

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

25/08/2022

0.20

$59.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate
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BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 25/08/2022 0.20 $59.00|Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the
Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nracacc tn 1indata

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 26/08/2022 0.20 $59.00|Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the
Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nracecc tn 1indate

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 9/09/2022 0.50 $147.50|Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a
deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 9/09/2022 0.90 $265.50[{Research on process to lodge unclaimed monies for an investment scheme to ASIC.
Reviewed ASIC websites to verify funds lodged for all types of investors i.e. individuals,
comnaniec and triicte

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 30/09/2022 0.40 $118.00|Reviewed invoice/prepared payment for license fee to maintain investor database. Saved
reauisition documents to file

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 4/10/2022 0.60 $177.00|Reviewed invoices/prepared payments for September barrister and legal fees. Saved to
file

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 18/10/2022 0.20 $59.00|Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaaement database and advise

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 18/10/2022 0.40 $118.00|Prepare letters to investors in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 19/10/2022 0.10 $29.50|Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 19/10/2022 0.10 $29.50|Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 19/10/2022 0.10 $29.50|Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be
updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accordinalyv

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 19/10/2022 0.10 $29.50|Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 10/11/2022 0.20 $59.00|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 10/11/2022 0.30 $88.50|Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their
raaiiact

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 29/11/2022 0.10 $29.50|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 30/11/2022 0.30 $88.50|Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a
deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 1/12/2022 0.20 $59.00|Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be
updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalyv

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 1/12/2022 0.10 $29.50(Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 8/12/2022 1.20 $354.00[Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letters to reauest new address details.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 12/12/2022 0.30 $88.50|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 12/12/2022 0.80 $236.00[Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 12/12/2022 0.50 $147.50|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 12/12/2022 0.80 $236.00[Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 12/12/2022 1.70 $501.50|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare

letter to reauest new address details.
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BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

13/12/2022

0.10

$29.50

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

13/12/2022

2.80

$826.00

Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

13/12/2022

$147.50

Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/12/2022

0.80

$236.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/12/2022

0.30

$88.50

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/12/2022

$29.50

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/12/2022

$147.50

Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/12/2022

0.30

$88.50

Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

15/12/2022

0.40

$118.00

Prepare letters to investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

15/12/2022

0.30

$88.50

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

16/12/2022

1.40

$413.00

Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

16/12/2022

0.20

$59.00

Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

16/12/2022

1.00

$295.00

Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

9/01/2023

0.20

$59.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

9/01/2023

0.20

$59.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

9/01/2023

0.20

$59.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

10/01/2023

0.30

$88.50

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

10/01/2023

0.20

$59.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaaement database and advise

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

10/01/2023

$29.50

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

10/01/2023

0.20

$59.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

10/01/2023

0.20

$59.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

12/01/2023

$29.50

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

13/01/2023

0.30

$88.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

13/01/2023

0.60

$177.00

Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details
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BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

17/01/2023

0.30

$88.50

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

18/01/2023

$29.50

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

19/01/2023

$88.50

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

20/01/2023

$29.50

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

20/01/2023

0.20

$59.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

24/01/2023

0.20

$59.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

24/01/2023

0.20

$59.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

24/01/2023

$29.50

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

25/01/2023

$147.50

Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

1/02/2023

0.20

$59.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

1/02/2023

0.20

$59.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

3/02/2023

0.40

$118.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

3/02/2023

0.30

$88.50

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

6/02/2023

0.20

$59.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/02/2023

0.20

$59.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/02/2023

0.30

$88.50

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/02/2023

0.20

$59.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/02/2023

$29.50

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/02/2023

$29.50

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinaly

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/02/2023

0.20

$59.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/02/2023

0.40

$118.00

Prepare letters to investors in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/02/2023

$29.50

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.
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BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/02/2023

$29.50

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

9/02/2023

0.30

$88.50

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

9/02/2023

0.30

$88.50

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

9/02/2023

$29.50

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

10/02/2023

0.20

$59.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/02/2023

0.30

$88.50

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/02/2023

0.20

$59.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/02/2023

0.10

$29.50

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

17/02/2023

$29.50

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

17/02/2023

0.20

$59.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

17/02/2023

0.60

$177.00

Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

21/02/2023

0.60

$177.00

Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/02/2023

0.30

$88.50

Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

24/02/2023

0.20

$59.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

24/02/2023

0.20

$59.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

27/02/2023

0.40

$118.00

Prepare letters to investors in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

27/02/2023

$29.50

Phone call from investor in response to their request to transfer units from a superfund

to their personal name. Access investor management database to review current
invectar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

27/02/2023

$29.50

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

27/02/2023

0.20

$59.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

1/03/2023

0.20

$59.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

9/03/2023

0.20

$59.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/03/2023

0.20

$59.00

Prepare letter to investor in response to their request to transfer units from a Super

Fund to their personal nhame. Access investor management database to review current
invectar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

16/03/2023

0.80

$236.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv
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BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

16/03/2023

0.20

$59.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

16/03/2023

0.20

$59.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

16/03/2023

0.40

$118.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac naer the Fiind'e nalicyv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

21/03/2023

$147.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

24/03/2023

1.40

$413.00

Preparation of R&P section and other sections within EIF report to creditors.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

30/03/2023

0.20

$59.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

30/03/2023

0.20

$59.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

30/03/2023

0.20

$59.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

6/04/2023

0.40

$118.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

11/04/2023

$29.50

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

12/04/2023

$29.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

12/04/2023

0.30

$88.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiind'e nolicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

13/04/2023

0.70

$206.50

Updated Receipts & Payments within 38th report to investors.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

13/04/2023

0.30

$88.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/04/2023

0.30

$88.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

18/04/2023

$29.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicyv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

28/04/2023

0.30

$88.50

Prepared payment of monthly IT maintenance expense for finPOWER investor server.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

28/04/2023

0.90

$265.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

15/02/2023

0.30

$72.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

15/02/2023

0.30

$72.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

16/02/2023

0.30

$72.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

16/02/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv
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BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

16/02/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

17/02/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

22/02/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund’s mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund’s database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

23/02/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund’s mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund’s database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

2/03/2023

$24.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund’s mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund’s database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

2/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their
reaiiect

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

2/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiind’c nalicv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

3/03/2023

$600.00

8 x Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

9/03/2023

$120.00

6 x Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

9/03/2023

$72.00

7 x Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

10/03/2023

$24.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund’s mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund’s database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

10/03/2023

$72.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

10/03/2023

$120.00

2 x Updated and Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off
documents to reauired investor via email or nost.

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

10/03/2023

$72.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

13/03/2023

$48.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

15/03/2023

$24.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund’s mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund’s database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinaly

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

16/03/2023

$96.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

16/03/2023

$24.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund’s mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund’s database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

17/03/2023

$24.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

21/03/2023

0.60

$144.00

4 x Review of correspondence from investors/advisors in relation to a change of details

request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to
nraceacc raniiact ac nar tha Fiind’c nalicwv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

22/03/2023

0.10

$24.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

23/03/2023

0.10

$24.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

24/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv
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BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

27/03/2023

$24.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund’s mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund’s database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

27/03/2023

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

27/03/2023

$24.00

Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

28/03/2023

$24.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund’s mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund’s database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

29/03/2023

$48.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund’s mailbox. Print email for letter response to be
updated in the Fund’s database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accordingly. Sent correspondence to the correct address

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

29/03/2023

$24.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

30/03/2023

$72.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

4/04/2023

$24.00

Draft a new accounts payable for Gadens' legal fees for period ending 31.03. Saved
supporting documentation to file and forwarded to manager for reviewal/ payment

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

4/04/2023

0.30

$72.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

6/04/2023

1.20

$288.00

33 x Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to
reauired investor via email or bost

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

6/04/2023

0.30

$72.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

12/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

12/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

12/04/2023

0.40

$96.00

Prepare letter to investor in response to their request to transfer units from a Super
Fund to their personal nhame. Access investor management database to review current
investor details and advise. Make changes to data base as required

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

13/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

3 x Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

13/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiind’e nolicv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

14/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

14/04/2023

$24.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund’s mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund’s database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

14/04/2023

$24.00

2 x Update for Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details

request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to
nraceacc raniiact ac nar tha Fiind’c nalicwv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

17/04/2023

$48.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

18/04/2023

$24.00

2 x Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.
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BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

18/04/2023

0.30

$72.00

3 x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

19/04/2023

$24.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund’s mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund’s database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

19/04/2023

$72.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

19/04/2023

$24.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

19/04/2023

$24.00

2 x update letter to investor confirming update of details for their investment with the
Fund. Access investor manaaement database to review current details

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

20/04/2023

$24.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

21/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

21/04/2023

0.50

$120.00

5 x Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

26/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

27/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

2 x Update letters to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

28/04/2023

0.10

$24.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

1/03/2023

0.80

$192.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiind’c nalicyv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

1/03/2023

$120.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

2/03/2023

0.30

$72.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

2/03/2023

0.60

$144.00

Prepare letters to investors in relation to requests for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investors and print investors balances.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

2/03/2023

$120.00

Prepare letter to investor confirming transfer of units for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

2/03/2023

0.40

$96.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiind’c nalicyv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

3/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

6/03/2023

1.30

$312.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

6/03/2023

0.30

$72.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

7/03/2023

0.40

$96.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

7/03/2023

0.30

$72.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

8/03/2023

$24.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaaement database and advise
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BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

8/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

14/03/2023

0.30

$72.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

14/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

14/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

14/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Phone call from investor in response to their request to transfer units from a superfund

to their personal name. Access investor management database to review current
invactar dataile and advice

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

14/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to investor in response to their request to transfer units from a Super

Fund to their personal name. Access investor management database to review current
invectar detaile and advice

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

15/03/2023

0.40

$96.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

16/03/2023

0.40

$96.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiind’e nolicv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

16/03/2023

$24.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the interim distribution to investors. Access
investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their request

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

17/03/2023

$24.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

17/03/2023

$24.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

20/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

20/03/2023

0.40

$96.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

21/03/2023

0.60

$144.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

21/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

22/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

23/03/2023

0.30

$72.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiind’c nalicyv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

24/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

27/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

27/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

27/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicyv
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BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

27/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

28/03/2023

0.30

$72.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

28/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

28/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

28/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

28/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

28/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

28/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

28/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

29/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to investor in response to their request to transfer units from a Super

Fund to their personal name. Access investor management database to review current
invectar detaile and advice

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

29/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to investor in response to their request to transfer units from a Super

Fund to their personal name. Access investor management database to review current
invactar dataile and advice

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

29/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to investor in response to their request to transfer units from a Super

Fund to their personal name. Access investor management database to review current
invectar detaile and advice

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

29/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

29/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

30/03/2023

0.40

$96.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

4/04/2023

0.10

$24.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

5/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

5/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

5/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

6/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

6/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

64




BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

6/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

6/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

11/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

11/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

12/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

12/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

13/04/2023

$24.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

13/04/2023

$24.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

14/04/2023

$24.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

14/04/2023

$48.00

Prepare letter to investor confirming transfer of units for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor manaagement database to review current details.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

14/04/2023

$120.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind’s nolicy

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

14/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

17/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

17/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

17/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their
reaiiect

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

18/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

18/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to investor in response to their request to transfer units from a Super

Fund to their personal nhame. Access investor management database to review current
invectar detaile and advice

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

18/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their

raaiiact

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

18/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their
reaiiect

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

18/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to investor confirming update of details for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

18/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv
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BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

18/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

19/04/2023

0.30

$72.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

19/04/2023

$24.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units. Access
investor management database to review current investor details and advise.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

21/04/2023

0.10

$24.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

21/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

21/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

26/04/2023

$24.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

26/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to investor to request id as their signature could not be matched to the
database.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

21/06/2022

1.20

$234.00

Prepared letters to 5 investors in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their
reaiiect

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

21/06/2022

0.80

$156.00

Review of correspondence from 3 investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

21/06/2022

0.60

$117.00

Prepare letters to 4 investors confirming update of details for their investment with the
Fund. Access investor manaagement database to review current details.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

21/06/2022

1.40

$273.00

Prepare letters to 7 executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from

a deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

24/06/2022

1.00

$195.00

Prepare letter to 8 investor confirming update of details for their investment with the
Fund. Access investor manaaement database to review current details

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

24/06/2022

0.80

$156.00

Prepare letter to 7 investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

24/06/2022

$214.50

Review of correspondence from 6 investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

1/07/2022

0.90

$175.50

Prepare letter to 5 executors of estate in response to their request to transfer units from

a deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

4/07/2022

1.00

$195.00

Review of correspondence from 5 investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiind’c nolicv

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

4/07/2022

$97.50

Review of correspondence from 5 investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiind’c nalicyv

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

5/07/2022

1.20

$234.00

Review of correspondence from 8 investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

8/07/2022

1.20

$234.00

Prepare letter to 4 investors in response to their request to transfer units from a Super

Fund to their personal name. Access investor management database to review current
invactar dataile and advice

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

8/07/2022

1.00

$195.00

Prepare a letter to 3 investors in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.
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BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

11/07/2022

1.20

$234.00

Prepare 6 letters to investors in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their

raaiiact

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

12/07/2022

1.00

$195.00

Review of correspondence from 3 investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

12/07/2022

$214.50

Prepare a letter to 4 investors in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their

raaiiact

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

15/07/2022

0.70

$136.50

Prepare a letter to 4 investors in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their
reaiiect

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

18/07/2022

0.80

$156.00

Prepare a letter to 5 investors in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their

raaiiact

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

19/07/2022

0.80

$156.00

Prepare 4 letters to investors in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their
reaiiect

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

19/07/2022

0.60

$117.00

Prepare letter to 2 investors in response to their request to transfer units from a Super

Fund to their personal name. Access investor management database to review current
invactar dataile and advice

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

19/07/2022

0.80

$156.00

Prepare a letter to 3 investors in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their
reaiiect

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

22/07/2022

0.80

$156.00

Prepare a letter to 3 investors in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their

raaiiact

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

25/07/2022

0.70

$136.50

Prepare a letter to 3 investors in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

25/07/2022

$97.50

Prepare letter to 2 investors confirming update of details for their investment with the
Fund. Access investor manaaement database to review current details

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

3/08/2022

0.70

$136.50

Prepare letter to 5 investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

3/08/2022

0.70

$136.50

Prepare a letter to 3 investors in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

4/08/2022

0.80

$156.00

Prepare a letter to 4 investors in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their

raaiiact

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

5/08/2022

0.60

$117.00

Prepare letter to 4 investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

5/08/2022

0.60

$117.00

Prepare a letter to 3 investors in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

15/08/2022

0.40

$78.00

Prepare a letter to 2 investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their
reaiiect

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

16/08/2022

0.70

$136.50

Prepare a letter to 4 investors in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

16/08/2022

0.60

$117.00

Prepare a letter to 3 investors in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their
reaiiect

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

19/08/2022

0.60

$117.00

Prepare a letter to 2 investors in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.
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BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

23/08/2022

0.90

$175.50

Prepare a letter to 3 investors in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

26/08/2022

0.30

$58.50

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

26/08/2022

$292.50

Review of 4 correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiind'e nolicv

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

26/08/2022

0.80

$156.00

Scanned 16 documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

29/08/2022

0.80

$156.00

Prepare letters to investors in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

29/08/2022

0.40

$78.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

30/08/2022

0.40

$78.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

6/09/2022

0.40

$78.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

12/09/2022

0.30

$58.50

Scanned 3 documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

13/09/2022

0.30

$58.50

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

21/09/2022

0.80

$156.00

Review of correspondence from 4 investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

21/09/2022

0.40

$78.00

Prepare a letter to 2 investors in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their

raaiiact

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

21/09/2022

0.40

$78.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

23/09/2022

$19.50

Scanned document and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

23/09/2022

0.20

$39.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

23/09/2022

0.10

$19.50

Prepare letter to investor confirming update of details for their investment with the Fund.
Access inve to review current details

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

26/09/2022

0.10

$19.50

Scanned 2 documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

27/09/2022

0.30

$58.50

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

27/09/2022

$97.50

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance and

deceased estate enquiry. Access investor management database, search for investor and
nrint invectar halance

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

29/09/2022

$58.50

Scanned 3 documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

29/09/2022

$97.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracece reaiiect ac nar the Fiind'e nalicy

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

29/09/2022

0.30

$58.50

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

29/09/2022

0.40

$78.00

Prepare a letter to 2 investors in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their

raaiiact
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BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

30/09/2022

0.30

$58.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

30/09/2022

0.20

$39.00

Scanned 2 documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

30/09/2022

0.60

$117.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

4/10/2022

0.30

$58.50

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

7/10/2022

0.20

$39.00

Scanned 3 documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

10/10/2022

0.20

$39.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

10/10/2022

0.30

$58.50

Prepare letter to executor of estate seeking to update the details for their investment

with the Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and
advice nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

10/10/2022

0.30

$58.50

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

11/10/2022

0.20

$39.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

14/10/2022

0.30

$58.50

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

14/10/2022

0.20

$39.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

14/10/2022

0.40

$78.00

Prepare letters to investors in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

14/10/2022

0.20

$39.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

14/10/2022

$19.50

Scanned document and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

17/10/2022

0.80

$156.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased
estate request to 4 beneficiaries. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient
documentation provided to process request as per the Fund's policy.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

17/10/2022

0.40

$78.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

17/10/2022

0.20

$39.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

17/10/2022

0.20

$39.00

Scanned 4 documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

17/10/2022

0.30

$58.50

Prepare letter to investor in response to their request to transfer units from a Super

Fund to their personal nhame. Access investor management database to review current
invectar detaile and advice

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

17/10/2022

0.40

$78.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

18/10/2022

0.20

$39.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv
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BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

18/10/2022

0.10

$19.50

Prepare letter to investor confirming update of details for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

21/10/2022

0.70

$136.50

Prepare a letter to adviser in relation to a request for a unit holding balance for 2

investors. Access investor management database, search for investor and print investor
halance

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

21/10/2022

0.20

$39.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

21/10/2022

0.20

$39.00

Scanned 2 documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

21/10/2022

0.30

$58.50

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

24/10/2022

$19.50

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

24/10/2022

0.30

$58.50

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaaement database and advise

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

25/10/2022

0.20

$39.00

Scanned 2 documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

25/10/2022

0.30

$58.50

Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

25/10/2022

0.30

$58.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

25/10/2022

0.20

$39.00

Phone call from investor in response to a confirmation of their request to transfer units.
Access investor management database to review current investor details and advise.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

25/10/2022

0.20

$39.00

Prepare letter to investor confirming update of details for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

25/10/2022

$19.50

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

25/10/2022

0.30

$58.50

Prepare letter to investor confirming update of details for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

31/10/2022

0.10

$19.50

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

14/11/2022

0.20

$39.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

14/11/2022

$97.50

Prepare letter to investor in response to their request to change details from a Super

Fund as trustee has passed away. Access investor management database to review
currant invector detaile and advice

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

14/11/2022

0.30

$58.50

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their

raaiiact

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

15/11/2022

0.40

$78.00

Prepare letter to 2 investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

15/11/2022

0.30

$58.50

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

15/11/2022

0.30

$58.50

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the winding up of the Fund. Access investor
manaaement database. search for investor and nrint investor balance.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

15/11/2022

0.30

$58.50

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

18/11/2022

0.20

$39.00

Scanned 6 documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

18/11/2022

0.20

$39.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

70




BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

18/11/2022

0.70

$136.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiind'e nalicyv

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

18/11/2022

$19.50

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

18/11/2022

0.20

$39.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

18/11/2022

0.30

$58.50

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

21/11/2022

0.40

$78.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their
reaiiect

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

21/11/2022

$19.50

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

21/11/2022

$19.50

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

22/11/2022

$39.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

22/11/2022

$19.50

Prepare letter to investor in response to their request to transfer units from a Super

Fund to their personal name. Access investor management database to review current
invactar dataile and advice

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

28/11/2022

0.20

$39.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

28/11/2022

0.20

$39.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

28/11/2022

0.20

$39.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their

raaiiact

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

28/11/2022

0.20

$39.00

Scanned 3 documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

29/11/2022

0.20

$39.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their
reaiiect

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

29/11/2022

$19.50

Scanned 3 documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

2/12/2022

0.60

$117.00

Prepare letters to investors in relation to a request for a unit holding balance and a

change of authority. Access investor management database, search for investor and
nrint invactar halance

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

2/12/2022

0.30

$58.50

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their
reaiiect

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

2/12/2022

0.10

$19.50

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

6/12/2022

0.20

$39.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

6/12/2022

1.30

$253.50

Reviewed returned email and record investor details in returned email register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

6/12/2022

1.00

$195.00

Reviewed returned email and record investor details in returned email register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

6/12/2022

0.50

$97.50

Reviewed returned email and record investor details in returned email register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

6/12/2022

0.40

$78.00

Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.
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BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 7/12/2022 1.00 $195.00[Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 7/12/2022 0.20 $39.00|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 7/12/2022 1.70 $331.50|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 7/12/2022 0.20 $39.00|Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the
Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nracacc tn 1indata

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 7/12/2022 0.20 $39.00|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 7/12/2022 1.50 $292.50|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 8/12/2022 2.00 $390.00|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 8/12/2022 1.10 $214.50|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 8/12/2022 1.90 $370.50|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 12/12/2022 0.30 $58.50|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 12/12/2022 1.00 $195.00|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 12/12/2022 0.70 $136.50|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 12/12/2022 0.20 $39.00|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 12/12/2022 0.80 $156.00[Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 12/12/2022 0.30 $58.50|Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a
deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 12/12/2022 0.30 $58.50|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 13/12/2022 0.30 $58.50|Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.
Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 13/12/2022 1.30 $253.50|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 13/12/2022 0.40 $78.00|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 13/12/2022 0.10 $19.50|Scanned 3 documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 16/12/2022 0.50 $97.50|Scanned 11 documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 16/12/2022 0.50 $97.50|Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 16/12/2022 0.70 $136.50|Prepare letter to investor in response to their request to transfer units and unit balance
from a Super Fund to their personal name. Access investor management database to
raview ciirrant invactar deataile and advice

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 16/12/2022 2.10 $409.50(Scanned and copied 72 documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents
to reauired investor via email or nost. (FauitiTrust return mail)

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 16/12/2022 0.40 $78.00|Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the
Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nracecc tn 1indate

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 20/12/2022 0.20 $39.00|Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate
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BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 20/12/2022 0.90 $175.50|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 21/12/2022 0.50 $97.50|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 21/12/2022 0.70 $136.50|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 21/12/2022 0.40 $78.00|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 21/12/2022 0.70 $136.50|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 21/12/2022 2.20 $429.00|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 21/12/2022 0.50 $97.50|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 23/12/2022 0.30 $58.50|Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the
Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nracacc tn 1indata

BR Miah Clarke Undergraduate Creditors 16/01/2023 0.60 $117.00|Prepare letters to investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the
Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nracecc tn 1indate

BR Miah Clarke Undergraduate Creditors 16/01/2023 0.90 $175.50|Prepare letters to investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the
Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nracacc tn 1indata

BR Miah Clarke Undergraduate Creditors 17/01/2023 1.00 $195.00(Prepare letters to investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the
Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nracecc tn 1indate

BR Miah Clarke Undergraduate Creditors 17/01/2023 0.80 $156.00(|Prepare letters to investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the
Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nracacc tn 1indata

BR Miah Clarke Undergraduate Creditors 20/01/2023 0.30 $58.50(|Preparing correspondence to investors in relation to a change of details/transfer of
units/transfer of units of deceased estate request, as per RW instructions. And
siibmittina for annrowval

BR Miah Clarke Undergraduate Creditors 25/01/2023 1.00 $195.00|Preparing correspondence to investors in relation to a change of details/transfer of
units/transfer of units of deceased estate request, as per RW instructions. And
ciihmittina far annrowval

BR Miah Clarke Undergraduate Creditors 25/01/2023 1.30 $253.50(Preparing correspondence to investors in relation to a change of details/transfer of
units/transfer of units of deceased estate request, as per RW instructions. And
siibmittina for annrowval

BR Miah Clarke Undergraduate Creditors 30/01/2023 0.60 $117.00|Preparing email correspondence to investors in response to change of details and
confirmation of chanae reauests

BR Miah Clarke Undergraduate Creditors 30/01/2023 0.20 $39.00(|Preparing mail correspondence to investors in response to change of details and
confirmation of chanae reauests

BR Miah Clarke Undergraduate Creditors 2/02/2023 0.10 $19.50|Emailing correspondence to investors in relation to a change of details/transfer of
units/transfer of units of deceased estate request, as per RW instructions. And
ciihmittina far annrowval

BR Miah Clarke Undergraduate Creditors 6/02/2023 0.10 $19.50([Scanning in correspondence to investors in relation to a change of details/transfer of
units/transfer of units of deceased estate request, as per RW instructions. And
siibmittina for annrowval

BR Miah Clarke Undergraduate Creditors 6/02/2023 0.10 $19.50|Emailing correspondence to investors in relation to a change of details/transfer of
units/transfer of units of deceased estate request, as per RW instructions. And
ciihmittina far annrowval

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 5/07/2021 1.30 $825.50(|reviewed correspondence from borrower regarding proceedings against EL/potential
proceedings against the EIF and Receiver/reviewed previous correspondence/prepare
recnonce

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 9/07/2021 1.20 $762.00|reviewed correspondence with borrower regarding potential proceedings/reviewed prior
correspondence with borrower and including with EL liquidators

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 12/07/2021 0.20 $127.00(telephone call with our solicitors regarding correspondence received from borrower and

nronosed resnonse
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BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 29/07/2021 0.10 $63.50|reviewed BAS

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 21/09/2021 0.20 $127.00|reviewed invoices/authorised payments

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 5/10/2021 0.20 $127.00|reviewed correspondence from ASIC regarding AFSL/prepared request to extend
suspension of AFSL

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 5/10/2021 0.10 $63.50|reviewed correspondence from ASIC regarding AFSL expert/sent response

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 7/10/2021 0.10 $63.50|authorised payments

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 26/10/2021 0.20 $127.00|reviewed three BAS's

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 27/10/2021 0.10 $63.50|reviewed correspondence from ASIC regarding extension of AFSL/reviewed extension
document

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 24/11/2021 0.10 $63.50|authorised payments

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 26/11/2021 0.10 $63.50|reviewed BAS

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 2/12/2021 1.40 $889.00|reviewed correspondence from defendants solicitors regarding proceedings brought by EL
liquidators and notice of non party disclosure/reviewed notice and documents subject to
tha natice/amail niir enlicitare reaardina came

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 8/12/2021 0.30 $190.50(reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding notice of non party disclosure in
respect of proceedings brought by the EL liquidators/prepared draft email to the EL
linnidatore/cant reenonce ta oinir enlicitare

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 14/12/2021 0.20 $127.00|reviewed invoices/authorised payments

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 8/03/2022 0.20 $131.00|reviewed invoices/authorised payments

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 8/03/2022 0.10 $65.50|reviewed two BAS's

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 12/04/2022 0.20 $131.00|reviewed invoices/authorised payments

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 21/04/2022 1.10 $720.50|meeting with Ryan Whyte regarding preparation of accounts from June 2011 to
date/issues to be considered

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 27/04/2022 0.40 $262.00|reviewed Corporations Act regarding requirements for audited accounts/email C1/JP
reaardinag preparation of accounts

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 24/05/2022 0.10 $65.50|reviewed two BAS's

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 30/06/2022 0.20 $131.00|reviewed invoices/authorised payments

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 30/06/2022 1.30 $851.50|reviewed file/outstanding issues

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 5/07/2022 0.10 $65.50|authorised payments

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 12/07/2022 0.10 $65.50|authorised payment

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 19/07/2022 0.20 $131.00|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding outstanding cost orders against
the FI liauidators/one amount aareed and other to be claimed

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 25/07/2022 0.10 $65.50(|reviewed invoice/authorised payment

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 3/08/2022 0.10 $65.50|reviewed correspondence regarding request for consent to two leases in relation to
borrower's propertv/sent resnonse

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 22/08/2022 0.10 $65.50|authorised payments

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 30/08/2022 0.20 $131.00|reviewed May, June and July BAS

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 7/09/2022 0.10 $65.50|authorised payments

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 28/09/2022 0.10 $65.50|reviewed BAS

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 1/11/2022 0.20 $131.00|reviewed invoices/authorised payments

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 7/11/2022 0.70 $458.50|reviewed correspondence from EL liquidators and borrower's solicitors regarding release
of securitv/reviewed documentation relatina to loan

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 8/11/2022 0.30 $196.50|reviewed correspondence from ASIC regarding expiry of AFSL/drafted response
reaardina status of windinag un and reauest for extension of AFSI

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 5/12/2022 0.10 $65.50|authorised payments

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 12/01/2023 0.10 $65.50|authorised payments

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 12/01/2023 0.10 $65.50|reviewed BAS
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BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 27/01/2023 0.10 $65.50(|reviewed invoice/authorised payment

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 30/01/2023 0.10 $65.50|reviewed BAS

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 7/02/2023 0.10 $65.50|authorised payments

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 8/02/2023 0.10 $65.50|reviewed BAS

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 28/02/2023 0.30 $196.50|reviewed draft affidavit in relation to judicial advice application/provided instructions to
finalise

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 28/02/2023 0.20 $131.00|meeting with our solicitors regarding judicial advice application/swear affidavit in support
of anplication

BR David Whyte Partner Trade On 19/03/2023 0.20 $131.00(reviewed invoices/authorised payments

BR David Whyte Partner Trade On 11/04/2023 0.10 $65.50(|reviewed invoices/authorised payments

BR David Whyte Partner Trade On 20/04/2023 0.10 $65.50(|reviewed/approved BAS's

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Trade On 27/01/2022 0.10 $53.00|Review and approve supplier payments including website hosting invoice.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Trade On 8/03/2022 0.40 $212.00|Review and amend/approve 4x supplier payments.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 1/07/2021 1.20 $408.00|Review David's application and affidavits for the equalisation payment, remuneration and
winding up of the Fund. Review and respond to our solicitors queries regarding the
affidavits.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 1/07/2021 0.40 $136.00|Prepare email to the printing company to prepare a quote for mailing out all of the
material for the application for the winding up of the fund to include in the affidavit.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 1/07/2021 0.90 $306.00|Review David's application and affidavits for the equalisation payment, remuneration and
winding up of the Fund. Review and respond to our solicitors queries regarding the
affidavite

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 2/07/2021 1.70 $578.00(|Prepare the narrations for period 1 May 2021 to 30 June 2021 to add to David' affidavit
for remuneration approval

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 2/07/2021 1.40 $476.00|Review David's application and affidavits for the equalisation payment, remuneration and
winding up of the Fund. Review and respond to our solicitors queries regarding the
affidavits.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 2/07/2021 0.90 $306.00|Review David's application and affidavits for the equalisation payment, remuneration and
winding up of the Fund. Review and respond to our solicitors queries regarding the
affidavits.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 5/07/2021 0.80 $272.00|Review David's application and affidavits for the equalisation payment, remuneration and
winding up of the Fund. Review and respond to our solicitors queries regarding the
affidavits.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 5/07/2021 1.30 $442.00|Review David's application and affidavits for the equalisation payment, remuneration and
winding up of the Fund. Review and respond to our solicitors queries regarding the
affidavits.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 5/07/2021 1.10 $374.00|Review David's application and affidavits for the equalisation payment, remuneration and
winding up of the Fund. Review and respond to our solicitors queries regarding the
affidavits.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 5/07/2021 1.20 $408.00|Review David's application and affidavits for the equalisation payment, remuneration and
winding up of the Fund. Review and respond to our solicitors queries regarding the
affidavits.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 6/07/2021 1.40 $476.00|Review David's application and affidavits for the equalisation payment, remuneration and

winding up of the Fund. Determine the position of the final accounts and provide
comments to Jayden.
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BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

12/07/2021

0.30

$102.00

Meeting with our solicitors regarding finalising the application for the winding up of the
Fund

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

13/07/2021

1.40

$476.00

Review and update the finalising liabilities affidavit, update the equalisation payment

calculations to include no set off and review Linda Rickard's affidavit for any updates for
cot nff RE finalicatinn annlicatinn

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

14/07/2021

$510.00

Review and update the finalising liabilities affidavit, update the equalisation payment

calculations to include no set off and review Linda Rickard's affidavit for any updates for
sot off RF finalicatinn annlication

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

15/07/2021

$306.00

Determine the cost and how we will prepare the accounts for the EIF for the 10 periods

or for the final accounts. Provide Jayden Comments for the application of the finalisation
of the windina 1in nf the Fiind

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

19/07/2021

$374.00

Review the EIF records to locate the last accounts prepared and finalised and also the

draft accounts for the year ended 30 June 2011 in order to consider how we prepare the
final accannts of the FIF

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

19/07/2021

0.70

$238.00

Review the EIF records to locate the last accounts prepared and finalised and also the

draft accounts for the year ended 30 June 2011 in order to consider how we prepare the
final accniinte nf the FTE

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

20/07/2021

0.70

$238.00

Review the EIF records to locate the last accounts prepared and finalised and also the

draft accounts for the year ended 30 June 2011 in order to consider how we prepare the
final accannts of the FIF

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

20/07/2021

1.00

$340.00

Review the EIF records to locate the last accounts prepared and finalised and also the

draft accounts for the year ended 30 June 2011 in order to consider how we prepare the
final accniinte nf the FTE

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

21/07/2021

1.40

$476.00

Review the EIF records to locate the last accounts prepared and finalised and also the

draft accounts for the year ended 30 June 2011 in order to consider how we prepare the
final accannts of the FIE Accecs MYOR ta exnart renorts

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

22/07/2021

0.80

$272.00

Review the EIF records to locate the last accounts prepared and finalised and also the

draft accounts for the year ended 30 June 2011 in order to consider how we prepare the
final accniinte af the ETE _Accace MYOR tn avnart renarte

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

22/07/2021

0.70

$238.00

Review the EIF records to locate the last accounts prepared and finalised and also the

draft accounts for the year ended 30 June 2011 in order to consider how we prepare the
final accannts of the FIE Accecs MYOR ta exnaort renorts

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

22/07/2021

$510.00

Review the EIF records to locate the last accounts prepared and finalised and also the

draft accounts for the year ended 30 June 2011 in order to consider how we prepare the
final accniinte af the ETE _Accace MYOR tn avnart renarte

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

23/07/2021

$204.00

Review the EIF records to locate the last accounts prepared and finalised and also the

draft accounts for the year ended 30 June 2011 in order to consider how we prepare the
final accannts of the FIE Accecs MYOR ta exnart renaorts

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

23/07/2021

$170.00

Review the EIF records to locate the last accounts prepared and finalised and also the

draft accounts for the year ended 30 June 2011 in order to consider how we prepare the
final accniinte af the ETE _Accace MYOR tn avnart renarte

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

27/07/2021

0.80

$272.00

Prepare the final drafts of the multiple affidavits and application for the application for
the equalisation payment, remuneration, final distribution and winding up of the Fund.

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

27/07/2021

0.60

$204.00

Prepare the final drafts of the multiple affidavits and application for the application for

the equalisation payment, remuneration, final distribution and winding up of the Fund.
Dicriice with lavden Caiiletan

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

27/07/2021

1.00

$340.00

Prepare the final drafts of the multiple affidavits and application for the application for

the equalisation payment, remuneration, final distribution and winding up of the Fund.
Dicriice with 1avden Caiileton

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

2/08/2021

0.30

$102.00

Request quote for the mail out of the auditors' report and final accounts to be included in
the application for the windina up of the Fund

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

3/08/2021

$170.00

Prepare email to our solicitors regarding the quotes obtained for the mail out to be
included in David's affidavits in support of the finalisation anolication

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

4/08/2021

0.40

$136.00

telephone call with Jayden Coulston regarding equalisation payment
calculations/finalisation of affidavit reaarding same

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

4/08/2021

0.40

$136.00

Review the final drafts of David Whyte's affidavits and application documents for the
finalisation application. Update where necessary and provide comments to Jayden.
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BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 4/08/2021 0.40 $136.00[telephone call with Jayden Coulston regarding equalisation payment affidavit for the
finalisation application

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 4/08/2021 0.60 $204.00|Review the final drafts of David Whyte's affidavits and application documents for the
finalisation application. Update where necessary and provide comments to Jayden.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 4/08/2021 1.20 $408.00[Review the final drafts of David Whyte's affidavits and application documents for the
finalisation application. Update where necessary and provide comments to Jayden.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 4/08/2021 0.90 $306.00[Calculate the hardship payment members as per David Whyte's comments to enter into
the eaualisation pavment affidavit for the finalisation apolication

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 4/08/2021 1.60 $544.00[Calculate the hardship payment members as per David Whyte's comments to enter into
the eaualisation pavment affidavit for the finalisation apoplication

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 4/08/2021 0.20 $68.00]|telephone call with Jayden Coulston and David Whyte regarding equalisation payment
calculations/finalisation of affidavit reaarding same

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 5/08/2021 0.70 $238.00[Calculate the hardship payment members as per David Whyte's comments to enter into
the eaualisation pavment affidavit for the finalisation apoplication

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 5/08/2021 1.60 $544.00[Calculate the hardship payment members as per David Whyte's comments to enter into
the eaualisation pavment affidavit for the finalisation apolication

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 5/08/2021 0.20 $68.00]|telephone call with Jayden Coulston and David Whyte regarding equalisation payment
calculations/finalisation of affidavit reaarding same

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 5/08/2021 0.60 $204.00[Calculate the hardship payment members as per David Whyte's comments to enter into
the eaualisation pavment affidavit for the finalisation apolication

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 5/08/2021 0.90 $306.00[Calculate the hardship payment members as per David Whyte's comments to enter into
the eaualisation pavment affidavit for the finalisation apolication

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 6/08/2021 0.60 $204.00|Telecon with Jayden Coulston regarding the material for the finalisation application and
where undates are reauired

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 6/08/2021 0.40 $136.00|Telecon with Jayden Coulston regarding the material for the finalisation application and
where undates are reauired

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 6/08/2021 0.20 $68.00(|Telecon with Jayden Coulston regarding the material for the finalisation application and
where undates are reauired

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 6/08/2021 0.10 $34.00|Telecon with Jayden Coulston regarding the material for the finalisation application and
where undates are reauired

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 6/08/2021 0.50 $170.00|Update the draft affidavits and application as per Jayden's comments for the hardship
eaualisation pavment amendments. RFE finalisation application

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 6/08/2021 1.00 $340.00|Update the draft affidavits and application as per Jayden's comments for the hardship
eaualisation pavment amendments. RFE finalisation application

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 6/08/2021 0.20 $68.00|Update the draft affidavits and application as per Jayden's comments for the hardship
eaualisation pavment amendments. RFE finalisation abplication

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 6/08/2021 0.80 $272.00|Update the draft affidavits and application as per Jayden's comments for the hardship
eaualisation pavment amendments. RFE finalisation application

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 9/08/2021 0.50 $170.00|Update the draft affidavits and application as per Jayden's comments for the hardship
eaualisation pavment amendments. RFE finalisation abplication

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 9/08/2021 0.40 $136.00|Meeting with David & Jayden regarding finalising the material for the finalisation
apnplication

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 9/08/2021 0.30 $102.00|Update the draft affidavits and application as per Jayden's comments for the hardship
eaualisation pavment amendments. RFE finalisation abplication

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 6/09/2021 0.30 $102.00|Prepare email to the email company for the mail out of the notice for the application of
the final distribution, equalisation payment, liquidators fees & expenses and winding up
of the Fiind

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 6/09/2021 0.30 $102.00|Prepare email to arrange for the notice to be put in the newspapers for the application of
the final distribution, equalisation payment, liquidators fees & expenses and winding up
of the Eiind

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 6/09/2021 0.30 $102.00|Prepare email to the printing company for the mail out of the notice for the application of
the final distribution, equalisation payment, liquidators fees & expenses and winding up
of the Fiind

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 6/09/2021 0.30 $102.00[Prepare email to the IT consultant to upload the notice & court documents for the

application of the final distribution, equalisation payment, liquidators fees & expenses
and windina 1in of the Fiind
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BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

6/09/2021

$374.00

Export and prepare the mailing list for the mail out of the notice for the application of the

final distribution, equalisation payment, liquidators fees & expenses and winding up of
the Fiind

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

7/09/2021

0.40

$136.00

Send the notice via email to the investors for the application of the final distribution,
equalisation payment, liquidators fees & expenses and winding up of the Fund.

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

9/09/2021

1.00

$340.00

Collate all of the information for the service on members of the notice for the application
of the final distribution, equalisation payment, liquidators fees & expenses and winding
up of the Fund to provide to our solicitors for my affidavit for service.

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

15/09/2021

0.30

$102.00

Review and update my affidavit for the service on members for the notice of the
finalisation matters to wind up the Fund

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

16/09/2021

0.40

$136.00

Attend our solicitors office to swear my affidavit for the service on members for the
notice of the finalisation matters to wind up the Fund

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

1/10/2021

0.20

$68.00

Attend our solicitors office to swear an affidavit regarding investor responses to the
notice of the aoplication for the windina up of the Fund

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

27/10/2021

0.60

$204.00

Locate the draft 30 June 2011 accounts prepared by Equititrust to provide to David in
preparation of preparing the accounts for all periods after our appointment.

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

5/11/2021

$374.00

Prepare mailing list as per Court orders to provide to the liquidators to notify investors
reaardina their claim for remuneration and exnenses from the FIF.

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

8/11/2021

$612.00

Review the draft financials of the EIF for 30 June 2011 to check against the records to

determine if any amendments are required prior to us finalising the accounts and
nrenarina the fiirther vear financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

9/11/2021

$170.00

Review the draft financials of the EIF for 30 June 2011 to check against the records to

determine if any amendments are required prior to us finalising the accounts and
nranarina the fiirthar vear financiale

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

18/11/2021

$374.00

Locate and export all information for the draft 30 June 2011 accounts in order to check

them for preparing the 30 June 2011 and onward accounts. Review the information for
acciiracvy anainet the draft acconinte

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

19/11/2021

$612.00

Locate and export all information for the draft 30 June 2011 accounts in order to check

them for preparing the 30 June 2011 and onward accounts. Review the information for
acciiracvy anainct tha draft accaninte

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

19/11/2021

$374.00

Locate and export all information for the draft 30 June 2011 accounts in order to check

them for preparing the 30 June 2011 and onward accounts. Review the information for
acciiracvy anainet the draft acconinte

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

19/11/2021

0.30

$102.00

Locate and export all information for the draft 30 June 2011 accounts in order to check

them for preparing the 30 June 2011 and onward accounts. Review the information for
acciiracvy anainct tha draft accaninte

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

19/11/2021

0.90

$306.00

Locate and export all information for the draft 30 June 2011 accounts in order to check

them for preparing the 30 June 2011 and onward accounts. Review the information for
acciiracvy anainet the draft acconinte

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

19/11/2021

$170.00

Locate and export all information for the draft 30 June 2011 accounts in order to check

them for preparing the 30 June 2011 and onward accounts. Review the information for
acciiracvy anainct tha draft accaninte

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

18/03/2022

$390.00

Continue preparing template to prepare the financial accounts for each audit period from
2011 to date.

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

6/04/2022

$585.00

Prepare financial statements template to prepare the financials for the period ended 30
June 2011 to the neriod ended 30 Tune 2021

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

6/04/2022

$195.00

Prepare financial statements template to prepare the financials for the period ended 30
June 2011 to the neriod ended 30 Tune 2021

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

6/04/2022

0.60

$234.00

Prepare financial statements template to prepare the financials for the period ended 30
June 2011 to the neriod ended 30 Tune 2021

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

7/04/2022

1.70

$663.00

Prepare financial statements template to prepare the financials for the period ended 30
June 2011 to the neriod ended 30 Tune 2021

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

7/04/2022

1.40

$546.00

Export information from the investor database and MYOB to prepare the financials for the
neriod ended 30 lune 2011 to the neriod ended 30 Tune 2021

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

8/04/2022

1.70

$663.00

Prepare financial statements template to prepare the financials for the period ended 30
June 2011 to the neriod ended 30 Tune 2021
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BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 11/04/2022 2.20 $858.00|Prepare financial statements template to prepare the financials for the period ended 30
June 2011 to the period ended 30 June 2021

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 11/04/2022 0.90 $351.00|Prepare financial statements template to prepare the financials for the period ended 30
June 2011 to the period ended 30 June 2021

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 19/04/2022 0.50 $195.00|Prepare financial statements template to prepare the financials for the period ended 30
June 2011 to the period ended 30 June 2021

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 20/04/2022 0.80 $312.00|Prepare financial statements template to prepare the financials for the period ended 30
June 2011 to the period ended 30 June 2021

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 20/04/2022 1.50 $585.00|Prepare financial statements template to prepare the financials for the period ended 30
June 2011 to the period ended 30 June 2021

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 21/04/2022 1.10 $429.00|meeting with David Whyte regarding preparation of accounts from June 2011 to
date/issues to be considered

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 21/04/2022 0.80 $312.00|Prepare financial statements template to prepare the financials for the period ended 30
June 2011 to the period ended 30 June 2021

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 21/04/2022 1.80 $702.00|Prepare financial statements template to prepare the financials for the period ended 30
June 2011 to the period ended 30 June 2021

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 21/04/2022 1.10 $429.00|Prepare financial statements template to prepare the financials for the period ended 30
June 2011 to the period ended 30 June 2021

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 21/04/2022 1.30 $507.00|Prepare financial statements template to prepare the financials for the period ended 30
June 2011 to the period ended 30 June 2021

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 22/04/2022 0.50 $195.00|Prepare financial statements template to prepare the financials for the period ended 30
June 2011 to the period ended 30 June 2021

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 29/04/2022 1.00 $390.00|Locate and review valuations for the properties held for each borrower of the EIF for
support in preparing the impairments for the financial accounts from FY2011 to FY2021.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 29/04/2022 0.80 $312.00|Locate and review valuations for the properties held for each borrower of the EIF for
support in preparing the impairments for the financial accounts from FY2011 to FY2021.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 29/04/2022 0.20 $78.00|Locate and review valuations for the properties held for each borrower of the EIF for
support in preparing the impairments for the financial accounts from FY2011 to FY2021.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 29/04/2022 2.40 $936.00(Locate and review valuations for the properties held for each borrower of the EIF for
support in preparing the impairments for the financial accounts from FY2011 to FY2021.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 4/05/2022 1.10 $429.00|Locate and review valuations for the properties held for each borrower of the EIF for
support in preparing the impairments for the financial accounts from FY2011 to FY2021.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 9/05/2022 1.70 $663.00|Prepare the 37th update report to creditors, update legal matters, prepare receipts and
navments and estimated retiirn.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 12/05/2022 1.40 $546.00|Prepare the 37th update report to creditors, update legal matters, prepare receipts and
navments and estimated retiirn.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 12/05/2022 1.60 $624.00|Prepare the 37th update report to creditors, update legal matters, prepare receipts and
navments and estimated retiirn.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 13/05/2022 0.90 $351.00|Prepare the 37th update report to creditors, update legal matters, prepare receipts and
navments and estimated retiirn.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 13/05/2022 1.50 $585.00(Prepare the 37th update report to creditors, update legal matters, prepare receipts and
navments and estimated retiirn.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 13/05/2022 1.00 $390.00(Prepare the 37th update report to creditors, update legal matters, prepare receipts and
navments and estimated retiirn.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 13/05/2022 0.20 $78.00|Prepare the 37th update report to creditors, update legal matters, prepare receipts and
navments and estimated retiirn.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 26/05/2022 0.40 $156.00(Prepare spreadsheet for the financial accounts ended 30 June 2011 to 30 June 2022.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 26/05/2022 1.40 $546.00(|Prepare spreadsheet for the financial accounts ended 30 June 2011 to 30 June 2022.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 27/05/2022 0.70 $273.00|Prepare spreadsheet for the financial accounts ended 30 June 2011 to 30 June 2022.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 27/05/2022 0.20 $78.00|Prepare spreadsheet for the financial accounts ended 30 June 2011 to 30 June 2022.
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BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

20/06/2022

1.60

$624.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

20/06/2022

1.20

$468.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

20/06/2022

$819.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

21/06/2022

0.90

$351.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

21/06/2022

1.70

$663.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

21/06/2022

0.80

$312.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

21/06/2022

$585.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

21/06/2022

1.20

$468.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

22/06/2022

1.60

$624.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

22/06/2022

0.90

$351.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

22/06/2022

1.20

$468.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

22/06/2022

2.20

$858.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

23/06/2022

2.90

$1,131.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

23/06/2022

$195.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials
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BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

23/06/2022

1.70

$663.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

23/06/2022

1.70

$663.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

23/06/2022

0.70

$273.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

24/06/2022

0.80

$312.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

24/06/2022

1.80

$702.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

27/06/2022

$585.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

27/06/2022

0.60

$234.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

27/06/2022

0.80

$312.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

27/06/2022

0.90

$351.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

27/06/2022

1.30

$507.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

28/06/2022

$195.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

29/06/2022

$975.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

29/06/2022

0.40

$156.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

30/06/2022

0.20

$78.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials
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BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 30/06/2022 1.80 $702.00|Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 30/06/2022 1.00 $390.00|Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 30/06/2022 2.10 $819.00|Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 30/06/2022 0.60 $234.00|Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 5/07/2022 1.30 $507.00|Prepare the financial accounts for the years ended 30 June 2011 to 30 June 2022.
Prepare impairments, trial balance, balance sheet, accruals, p&l, cashflows and notes.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 5/07/2022 1.80 $702.00(|Prepare the financial accounts for the years ended 30 June 2011 to 30 June 2022.
Prepare impairments, trial balance, balance sheet, accruals, p&l, cashflows and notes.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 6/07/2022 0.60 $234.00|Prepare the financial accounts for the years ended 30 June 2011 to 30 June 2022.
Prepare impairments, trial balance, balance sheet, accruals, p&l, cashflows and notes.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 6/07/2022 1.30 $507.00(|Prepare the financial accounts for the years ended 30 June 2011 to 30 June 2022.
Prepare impairments, trial balance, balance sheet, accruals, p&l, cashflows and notes.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 7/07/2022 1.80 $702.00|Prepare the financial accounts for the years ended 30 June 2011 to 30 June 2022.
Prepare impairments, trial balance, balance sheet, accruals, p&l, cashflows and notes.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 7/07/2022 0.80 $312.00(|Prepare the financial accounts for the years ended 30 June 2011 to 30 June 2022.
Prepare impairments, trial balance, balance sheet, accruals, p&l, cashflows and notes.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 8/07/2022 1.00 $390.00|Update 37th report to investors for outstanding matters and estimated return and
receints & navments as at 30 June 2022

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 8/07/2022 0.40 $156.00|Prepare the financial accounts for the years ended 30 June 2011 to 30 June 2022.
Prepare impairments, trial balance, balance sheet, accruals, p&l, cashflows and notes.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 13/07/2022 1.90 $741.00|Prepare the financial accounts for the years ended 30 June 2011 to 30 June 2022.
Prepare impairments, trial balance, balance sheet, accruals, p&l, cashflows and notes.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 13/07/2022 0.30 $117.00|Prepare the financial accounts for the years ended 30 June 2011 to 30 June 2022.
Prepare impairments, trial balance, balance sheet, accruals, p&l, cashflows and notes.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 18/07/2022 0.50 $195.00|{Update the 37th report to creditors as per David's comments.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 18/07/2022 1.60 $624.00|Export the mailing list, prepare and sort the mailing list to send the report to investors
dated 18 lulv 2022 to investors via email and nost.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 18/07/2022 1.00 $390.00(|Arrange for the 37th report to investors to be posted to the website, sent via email and
nosted.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 17/08/2022 1.20 $468.00[Review previous financials and other documentation. Prepare the opening balances for
the financial accounts for the neriod endina 30 Tune 2023,

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 17/08/2022 1.30 $507.00[Review previous financials and other documentation. Prepare the opening balances for
the financial accounts for the neriod endina 30 Tune 2023,

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 17/08/2022 0.60 $234.00[Review previous financials and other documentation. Prepare the opening balances for
the financial accounts for the neriod endina 30 Tune 2023,

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 18/08/2022 1.80 $702.00[Review previous financials and other documentation. Prepare the opening balances for

the financial accounts for the neriod endina 30 lune 2023,
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BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 19/08/2022 1.50 $585.00[Review previous financials and other documentation. Prepare the opening balances for
the financial accounts for the period endinag 30 June 2023

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 4/11/2022 1.60 $624.00|Export transfer listing from July 2021 to November 2022. Use information to update the
equalisation payment spreadsheet to reflect the new parties for payment at the end of
tha racsivarchin

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 4/11/2022 1.70 $663.00|Export transfer listing from July 2021 to November 2022. Use information to update the
equalisation payment spreadsheet to reflect the new parties for payment at the end of
the receiverchin

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 4/11/2022 1.10 $429.00|Export transfer listing from July 2021 to November 2022. Use information to update the
equalisation payment spreadsheet to reflect the new parties for payment at the end of
tha racsivarchin

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 4/11/2022 1.90 $741.00|Export transfer listing from July 2021 to November 2022. Use information to update the
equalisation payment spreadsheet to reflect the new parties for payment at the end of
the receiverchin

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 7/11/2022 1.00 $390.00|Export transfer listing from July 2021 to November 2022. Use information to update the
equalisation payment spreadsheet to reflect the new parties for payment at the end of
tha racsivarchin

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 9/11/2022 0.70 $273.00|Export transfer listing from July 2021 to November 2022. Use information to update the
equalisation payment spreadsheet to reflect the new parties for payment at the end of
the receiverchin

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 9/11/2022 0.40 $156.00|Export transfer listing from July 2021 to November 2022. Use information to update the
equalisation payment spreadsheet to reflect the new parties for payment at the end of
tha racsivarchin

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 8/02/2023 1.00 $390.00(Prepare estimated return to 31 Jan 23 for David's affidavit.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 8/02/2023 1.20 $468.00|Review narrations to identify time spent on the EL liquidators claim

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 20/03/2023 2.10 $819.00|Export narrations, review and summarise with all other annexures for David's affidavit
for the finalisation annlication.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 21/03/2023 1.50 $585.00|Export narrations, review and summarise with all other annexures for David's affidavit
for the finalisation annlication.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 11/04/2023 1.60 $624.00|Review and update the affidavits for the winding up application amendment. Update
eaualisation navment snreadsheet and nrenare the estimated return.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 11/04/2023 2.30 $897.00[Review and update the affidavits for the winding up application amendment. Update
eaualisation navment snreadsheet and nrenare the estimated return.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 11/04/2023 1.50 $585.00(Prepare 38th report to investors including estimated return, receipts and payments and
claims.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 13/04/2023 1.40 $546.00|Update estimated return and affidavits for the winding up application amendment

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 14/04/2023 1.20 $468.00(Prepare 38th report to investors including estimated return, receipts and payments and
claims.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 20/04/2023 1.00 $390.00[Review amended application and equalisation payment figures to determine how the
equalisation payment can be processed in the Fund's database. Prepare email to intersoft
tn determine how to nrocecc

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Trade On 31/03/2022 0.30 $72.00|Preparing payment to finPOWER for monthly license fee.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Trade On 29/04/2022 0.30 $72.00|Locate and review valuations for the properties held for each borrower of the EIF for
support in preparing the impairments for the financial accounts from FY2011 to FY2021.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Trade On 29/04/2022 0.70 $168.00(|Locate and review valuations for the properties held for each borrower of the EIF for
support in preparing the impairments for the financial accounts from FY2011 to FY2021.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Trade On 29/04/2022 0.30 $72.00|Locate and review valuations for the properties held for each borrower of the EIF for
support in preparing the impairments for the financial accounts from FY2011 to FY2021.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Trade On 29/04/2022 2.70 $648.00(|Locate and review valuations for the properties held for each borrower of the EIF for
support in preparing the impairments for the financial accounts from FY2011 to FY2021.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Trade On 7/07/2022 0.70 $168.00|Building asset impairments master spreadsheet for purposes of financial accounts for

impairments of the loans
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BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Trade On 7/07/2022 1.00 $240.00(Building asset impairments master spreadsheet for purposes of financial accounts for
impairments of the loans

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Trade On 11/07/2022 0.90 $216.00(Building asset impairments master spreadsheet for purposes of management accounts
for uncomina FTF report to investors

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Trade On 11/07/2022 0.50 $120.00|Building asset impairments master spreadsheet for purposes of financial accounts for
impairments of the loans

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Trade On 12/07/2022 0.90 $216.00(Building asset impairments master spreadsheet for purposes of management accounts
for uncomina FIF report to investors

BR David Whyte Appointee Administration 2/07/2021 1.10 $698.50|reviewed annexures for remuneration application/timesheet narrations for May and June
2021

BR David Whyte Appointee Administration 5/07/2021 0.30 $190.50][telephone call with Jayden Coulston regarding queries on draft affidavit relating to
eaualisation pavments

BR David Whyte Appointee Administration 5/07/2021 0.20 $127.00[telephone call with our solicitors regarding applications to court to finalise
administration/availabilitv of counsel/finalisation of material

BR David Whyte Appointee Administration 5/07/2021 0.60 $381.00|reviewed draft affidavit and previous correspondence regarding equalisation
pavment/hardshin navments/transfers nost anbointment

BR David Whyte Appointee Administration 7/07/2021 0.80 $508.00|reviewed updates to three affidavits to finalise administration/reviewed terms of hardship
pavment relief/reviewed draft undate to our solicitors

BR David Whyte Appointee Administration 4/08/2021 0.20 $127.00[telephone call with Jayden Coulston and Ryan Whyte regarding equalisation payment
calculations/finalisation of affidavit reaarding same

BR David Whyte Appointee Administration 4/08/2021 1.60 $1,016.00|reviewed four affidavits and two applications in relation to finalising the receivership

BR David Whyte Appointee Administration 4/08/2021 0.50 $317.50|reviewed affidavit regarding equalisation payment and finalisation of receivership

BR David Whyte Appointee Administration 5/08/2021 0.20 $127.00[telephone call with JC and RW regarding equalisation payment calculations in respect of
hardship redemptions

BR David Whyte Appointee Administration 9/08/2021 0.70 $444.50][telephone call with Jayden Coulston and Ryan Whyte regarding draft affidavits to support
court applications to finalise administration/obtain remuneration
annraval/raviewad/finalicad affidavite and raviewad draft email ta anr enlicitare

BR David Whyte Appointee Administration 13/08/2021 0.70 $444.50|attended our solicitors offices, reviewed and executed three affidavits regarding
finalisation of receivershin and eaualisation havment

BR David Whyte Appointee Administration 30/08/2021 0.20 $127.00(|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors and EL liquidators solicitors regarding
indemnitv annlication and nronosed orders/reviewed draft resnonse

BR David Whyte Appointee Administration 30/08/2021 0.20 $127.00(|reviewed submissions in relation to application to substituted service and to finalise the
administration

BR David Whyte Appointee Administration 29/09/2021 0.10 $63.50(|reviewed draft affidavit in relation to court application for remuneration approval

BR David Whyte Appointee Administration 17/02/2022 0.20 $131.00(|reviewed ASIC annual return form 5602

BR David Whyte Appointee Administration 7/02/2023 0.10 $65.50|reviewed ASIC annual return form 5602

BR David Whyte Partner Administration 19/03/2023 3.70 $2,423.50|reviewed timesheet narrations for the period 1 July 2021 to 28 February 2023 for
remuneration annlication/finalisation annlication

BR David Whyte Partner Administration 11/04/2023 0.90 $589.50(|reviewed amended application regarding finalisation/reviewed supporting affidavits in
resnect of eaualisation navment and remuneration

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 1/07/2021 0.10 $54.00|Review email regarding affidavit and court

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 27/07/2021 0.10 $54.00|Review June BAS

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 28/07/2021 0.10 $54.00|Review affidavit material

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 3/08/2021 0.10 $54.00|Review correspondence to bank

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 26/08/2021 0.20 $108.00[Review seven changes of details requests and correspondence to investors

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 31/08/2021 0.10 $54.00(|Three letters to investors with unit balance updates and change of details

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 1/09/2021 0.20 $108.00[Review email from lawyer and next steps re notice and lodgements
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BR Charles Haines Director Administration 6/09/2021 0.10 $54.00|Review email from lawyers re proceedings

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 17/09/2021 0.20 $108.00|Review and approve 6 payments to creditors

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 18/10/2021 0.10 $54.00(three change of details letters

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 22/10/2021 0.10 $54.00|Review August BAS

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 22/10/2021 0.10 $54.00|Review July BAS

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 26/10/2021 0.10 $54.00|Review September BAS and associated workpapers

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 1/11/2021 0.10 $54.00|Review and authorise finPOWER payment

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 15/11/2021 0.10 $54.00|Review correspondence from solicitors regarding proceedings

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 23/11/2021 0.10 $54.00|October BAS

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 11/01/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review November BAS and associated refund calcs

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 24/05/2022 0.20 $111.00|Review March and April BAS and workpapers

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 25/05/2022 0.10 $55.50|{Review and approve Feb BAS

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 29/06/2022 0.20 $111.00|Review and approve 5 payments to solicitors and service providers

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 5/07/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review and authorise payment to Gadens

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 7/07/2022 0.20 $111.00(4 letters to investors regarding unit balance updates and general updates

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 12/08/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review and authorise payment to Gadens for legal fees

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 16/08/2022 0.10 $55.50[Two letters to investors regarding updates and additional information required to update
account holdinas

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 19/08/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review and approve payment of finPOWER costs

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 29/08/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review May BAS and associated workpapers

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 29/08/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review June BAS and associated workpapers

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 29/08/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review July BAS and associated workpapers

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 7/09/2022 0.30 $166.50|Update staff regarding proposed settlement arrangements and strategy regarding final
dividend, accounts, court application and process for dealing with unclaimed funds of
final dictrihutinn

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 27/09/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review and approve August BAS

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 30/09/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review and approve accounts payable payment

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 27/10/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review and approve legal fees

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 28/10/2022 0.10 $55.50|Account payments and reconciliation

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 28/10/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review update on payments of receivership expenses

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 31/10/2022 0.10 $55.50|Update regarding deed of settlement and response from Hall Chadwick

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 1/11/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review and approve payment
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BR Charles Haines Director Administration 1/11/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review and approve solicitors payment

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 12/01/2023 0.1